

Dennis F. Dunne  
Evan R. Fleck  
MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & M<sup>c</sup>CLOY LLP  
1 Chase Manhattan Plaza  
New York, NY 10005  
Telephone: (212) 530-5000

*Counsel for Official Committee of Unsecured  
Creditors of Arcapita Bank B.S.C.(c), et al.*

**UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK**

----- X	
	:
<b>In re:</b>	:
	:
	:
<b>ARCAPITA BANK B.S.C.(c), et al.,</b>	:
	:
	:
<b>Reorganized Debtors.</b>	:
	:
	:
----- X	

**Chapter 11**  
**Case No. 12-11076 (SHL)**  
**Confirmed**

**EIGHTEENTH FEE STATEMENT OF MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & M<sup>c</sup>CLOY LLP FOR COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED AS COUNSEL TO OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS DURING PERIOD FROM SEPTEMBER 1, 2013 THROUGH AND INCLUDING SEPTEMBER 17, 2013**

Name of applicant:	<u>Milbank, Tweed, Hadley &amp; M<sup>c</sup>Cloy LLP</u>
Authorized to provide professional services to:	<u>Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors</u>
Date of retention:	<u>Order entered on June 29, 2012, retaining Milbank nunc pro tunc to April 10, 2012</u>
Period for which compensation and reimbursement is sought:	<u>September 1, 2013 – September 17, 2013</u>
Amount of compensation requested:	<u>\$1,209,850.50</u>
Amount of expense reimbursement requested:	<u>\$6,641.62</u>

Milbank, Tweed, Hadley & McCloy LLP ("Milbank"), counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (the "Committee") of Arcapita Bank B.S.C.(c) and its affiliated debtors and debtors in possession in the above-captioned chapter 11 cases (collectively, the "Debtors")<sup>1</sup>, hereby submits this monthly fee statement (the "Fee Statement"), pursuant to this Court's Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals, dated May 18, 2012 (the "Interim Compensation Order"), seeking compensation and reimbursement of expenses for the period of September 1, 2013 through and including September 17, 2013 (the "Eighteenth Monthly Period"). By this Fee Statement, Milbank seeks (i) payment of \$967,880.40, which is equal to eighty percent (80%) of the total amount of compensation sought for actual and necessary professional services rendered during the Eighteenth Monthly Period (i.e., \$1,209,850.50), and (ii) reimbursement of \$6,641.62, which is equal to one hundred percent (100%) of its actual and necessary expenses incurred in connection with such services.<sup>2</sup>

Attached hereto as Exhibit A are time entry records for the Eighteenth Monthly Period that were recorded in tenths of an hour by project category, maintained in the ordinary course of Milbank's practice, and that set forth a detailed description of services performed by each attorney and paraprofessional on behalf of the Committee. A summary of compensation sought by project category is provided below.

---

<sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases are Arcapita Bank B.S.C.(c), Arcapita Investment Holdings Limited, Arcapita LT Holdings Limited, WindTurbine Holdings Limited, AEID II Holdings Limited, RailInvest Holdings Limited, and Falcon Gas Storage Company, Inc.

<sup>2</sup> The foregoing amounts reflect a voluntary reduction of certain amounts in fees. However, Milbank reserves the right to seek the allowance of all or a portion of such amounts at a later date.

Attached hereto as Exhibit B are itemized records of all expenses for the Eighteenth Monthly Period incurred in connection with the performance of professional services. A summary of reimbursement sought by expense type is provided below.

This Fee Statement also includes a billing summary by individual, setting forth the (i) name and title of each individual for whose work on these cases compensation is sought, (ii) aggregate time expended by each such individual, (iii) hourly billing rate for each such individual at Milbank's current billing rates, (iv) year of bar admission for each attorney, (v) number of years each attorney has held his or her position at Milbank, and (vi) area of concentration for each attorney.

**EIGHTEENTH FEE STATEMENT OF MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & M<sup>C</sup>CLOY LLP  
AS COUNSEL TO OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS  
OF ARCAPITA BANK B.S.C.(C), ET AL.  
(SEPTEMBER 1, 2013 – SEPTEMBER 17, 2013)**

<b>Name</b>	<b>Position; Experience</b>	<b>Hourly Rate</b>	<b>Total Hours</b>	<b>Total Compensation</b>
Dennis Dunne	Financial Restructuring Partner at Milbank for 15 years; admitted in 1991.	\$1,160	7.90	\$9,164.00
John Dewar	Global Project Finance Partner at Milbank for 5 years; admitted in 1991.	\$1,160	21.40	\$24,824.00
Wilber Foster	Financial Restructuring Partner at Milbank for 22 years; admitted in 1982.	\$1,160	1.60	\$1,856.00
Thomas Janson	Global Corporate Partner at Milbank for 11 years; admitted in 1985.	\$1,160	8.90	\$10,324.00
Andrew Leblanc	Litigation Partner for 7 years; admitted in 1998.	\$1,160	3.50	\$4,060.00
Jane Morgan	Global Corporate Partner at Milbank for 2 years; admitted in 1997.	\$1,160	143.60	\$166,576.00
Albert Pisa	Alternative investments Partner at Milbank for 9 years; admitted in 1967.	\$1,160	1.50	\$1,740.00
Andrew Walker	Tax Partner at Milbank for 11 years; admitted in 1995.	\$1,160	2.40	\$2,784.00
Mark Stamp	Global Corporate Partner at Milbank for 1 year; admitted in 1985.	\$1,160	58.30	\$67,628.00
Wayne Aaron	Litigation Partner at Milbank for 9 years; admitted in 1996.	\$1,050	1.70	\$1,785.00
Peter Schwartz	Global Securities Partner at Milbank for 3 years; admitted in 1998.	\$1,050	7.60	\$7,980.00
Evan Fleck	Financial Restructuring Partner at Milbank for 3 years; admitted in 2002.	\$1,000	126.50	\$126,500.00
Joel Krasnow	Tax Partner at Milbank for 5 years; admitted in 1990.	\$1,000	.70	\$700.00
Dorothy Heyl	Litigation Of Counsel At Milbank for 9 years; admitted in 1984.	\$955	3.00	\$2,865.00

<b>Name</b>	<b>Position; Experience</b>	<b>Hourly Rate</b>	<b>Total Hours</b>	<b>Total Compensation</b>
Lena Mandel	Senior Attorney at Milbank for 11 years; admitted in 1990.	\$810	12.60	\$10,206.00
Matthew Mortimer	Tax Associate at Milbank for 6 years; admitted in 2009.	\$805	35.40	\$28,497.00
Jennifer Harris	Alternative Investments Associate at Milbank for 9 years; admitted in 2000.	\$780	31.70	\$24,726.00
Peter Newman	Financial Restructuring Associate at Milbank for 9 years; admitted in 2005.	\$780	18.00	\$14,040.00
Kim Shah	Global Corporate Associate at Milbank for 2 years; admitted in 2006.	\$755	136.90	\$103,359.50
Patrick Tierney	Real Estate Associate at Milbank for 1 year; admitted in 2007.	\$755	17.70	\$13,363.50
Daniel Wayte	Global Corporate Associate at Milbank for 1 year; admitted in 2005.	\$755	6.80	\$5,134.00
Merih O. Altay	Global Corporate Associate at Milbank for 7 years; admitted in 2006.	\$740	71.10	\$52,614.00
Nicholas Bassett	Litigation Associate at Milbank for 7 years; admitted in 2007.	\$740	9.30	\$6,882.00
Aluyah I. Imoisili	Litigation Associate at Milbank for 7 years; admitted in 2006.	\$740	4.10	\$3,034.00
Samir Vora	Litigation Associate at Milbank for 6 years; admitted in 2007.	\$725	4.30	\$3,117.50
Andrew H. Everett II	Global Corporate Associate at Milbank for 5 years; admitted in 2009.	\$700	98.30	\$68,810.00
Jonathon Jackson	Global Securities Associate at Milbank for 1 year; admitted in 2009.	\$700	17.60	\$12,320.00
Nicholas Kamphaus	Financial Restructuring Associate at Milbank for 2 years; admitted in 2009.	\$700	103.90	\$72,730.00
Roger Lee	Financial Restructuring Associate at Milbank for 5 years; admitted in 2009.	\$700	36.30	\$25,410.00
David Mollo-Christensen	Tax Associate at Milbank for 1 year; admitted in 2009.	\$700	1.90	\$1,330.00

<b>Name</b>	<b>Position; Experience</b>	<b>Hourly Rate</b>	<b>Total Hours</b>	<b>Total Compensation</b>
Julia Fish	Alternative Investment Associate At Milbank for 4 years; admitted in 2010.	\$680	48.60	\$33,048.00
Bradley Friedman	Financial Restructuring Associate at Milbank for 4 years; admitted in 2010.	\$680	1.10	\$748.00
Hannah Dworkis	Global Corporate Associate at Milbank for 3 years; admitted in 2011.	\$645	5.10	\$3,289.50
Aaron Stine	Global Corporate Associate at Milbank for 3 years; admitted in 2011.	\$645	140.70	\$90,751.50
Greta Ulvad	Financial Restructuring Associate at Milbank for 2 years; admitted in 2011.	\$645	79.20	\$51,084.00
Munib Hussain	Global Project Finance Associate at Milbank for 2 years; admitted in 2012.	\$585	102.40	\$59,904.00
Andrew Tsang	Financial Restructuring Associate at Milbank for 2 years; admitted in 2012.	\$585	26.20	\$15,327.00
Kevin Begley	Global Corporate Associate at Milbank for 1 year; admitted in 2013.	\$480	2.70	\$1,296.00
Vicky Cox	Global Project Finance Associate at Milbank for 1 year; admitted in 2013.	\$480	1.50	\$720.00
James Ebberson	Global Corporate Associate at Milbank for 1 year; admitted in 2013.	\$480	78.50	\$37,680.00
Amy Kurtich	Global Corporate Associate at Milbank for 1 year; admitted in 2013.	\$480	68.60	\$32,928.00
Theophile Jomier	Legal Assistant	\$220	23.00	\$5,060.00
Charmaine Thomas	Legal Assistant	\$220	2.60	\$572.00
Jacqueline Brewster	Legal Assistant	\$205	2.10	\$430.50
Egzon Thaqi	Legal Assistant	\$200	6.00	\$1,200.00
Rohan S. Kazi	Legal Assistant	\$175	8.30	\$1,452.50

Name	Position; Experience	Hourly Rate	Total Hours	Total Compensation
<b>Total</b>		<b>\$760.39 (blended rate)<sup>3</sup></b>	<b>1,591.10 hours</b>	<b>\$1,209,850.50</b>

---

<sup>3</sup> The blended rate excluding paraprofessionals is \$775.38 per hour.

\* Milbank bills travel time at 50% of its normal rates.

**EIGHTEENTH FEE STATEMENT OF MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & M<sup>C</sup>CLOY LLP  
AS COUNSEL TO OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS  
OF ARCAPITA BANK B.S.C.(C), ET AL.  
(SEPTEMBER 1, 2013 – SEPTEMBER 17, 2013)**

<b>ACTIVITY</b>	<b>HOURS</b>	<b>FEES</b>
Asset Sales	207.70	\$182,073.00
Bahrain Issues	3.90	\$2,535.00
Cash Management	.60	\$420.00
Claims Analysis and Estimation	37.40	\$25,038.50
Committee Administration	23.50	\$15,778.00
Committee Meetings	22.80	\$21,340.00
Communication with Creditors & Website	4.60	\$1,729.50
Corporate Matters	836.80	\$584,758.50
Court Hearings	2.90	\$1,318.00
Employee Issues	6.10	\$5,126.00
Executory Contracts	1.50	\$877.50
Exit Financing	68.50	\$47,659.50
Fee Applications - Other	1.00	\$661.50
File, Docket and Calendar Maintenance	6.10	\$1,939.00
Investments and Portfolio Companies	.50	\$350.00
Insurance Matters	7.70	\$5,642.50
Islamic Finance Issues	4.40	\$3,432.00
Litigation	4.20	\$4,550.00
Milbank Fee Statements and Applications	28.70	\$18,522.50
Real Estate Matters	40.70	\$33,508.00
Reorganization Plan	151.80	\$138,456.00
Retention Of Professionals	8.50	\$5,884.00
Secured Creditor Issues	.90	\$630.00
Tax Issues	3.60	\$3,624.00
Voidable Transfers	9.00	\$6,488.50
Aim MSA	107.70	\$97,509.00



<b>ACTIVITY</b>	<b>HOURS</b>	<b>FEES</b>
<b>Total</b>	<b>1,591.10</b>	<b>\$1,209,850.50</b>

**EIGHTEENTH FEE STATEMENT OF MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & M<sup>C</sup>CLOY LLP  
AS COUNSEL TO OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS  
OF ARCAPITA BANK B.S.C.(C), ET AL.  
(SEPTEMBER 1, 2013 – SEPTEMBER 17, 2013)**

<b><u>DISBURSEMENTS</u></b>	<b><u>AMOUNT</u></b>
Airfreight	\$14.82
Cab Fares	\$999.92
Color Copies	\$125.75
Computer Database Research	\$346.12
Meals	\$462.37
Photocopies/Printing	\$3,295.80
Telephone	\$711.62
Travel	\$685.22
<b>TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS</b>	<b><u>\$6,641.62</u></b>

**Notice**

No trustee or examiner has been appointed in these chapter 11 cases. Notice of this Fee Statement has been served upon (i) Eugene I. Davis, Chairman of the Board of Directors of RA Holding Corp., 5 Canoe Brook Drive, Livingston, New Jersey 07039; and (ii) the Office of the United States Trustee for the Southern District of New York, 33 Whitehall Street, 21st Floor, New York, New York 10004 (Attn: Richard Morrissey, Esq.). Milbank submits that, in light of the relief requested, no other or further notice need be provided.

**WHEREFORE**, Milbank respectfully requests (i) interim allowance of compensation for professional services rendered during the Eighteenth Monthly Period, in the amount of \$1,209,850.50, and reimbursement for expenses incurred in connection with such services, in the amount of \$6,641.62 and (ii) payment and reimbursement in accordance with the procedures set forth in the Interim Compensation Order (i.e., payment of eighty percent (80%) of the compensation sought, in the amount of \$967,880.40, and reimbursement of one hundred percent (100%) of expenses incurred), in the total amount of \$974,522.02.

Dated: October 3, 2013  
New York, New York

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & M<sup>c</sup>CLOY LLP**

/s/ Dennis F. Dunne

Dennis F. Dunne

Evan R. Fleck

One Chase Manhattan Plaza

New York, NY 10005-1413

Telephone: (212) 530-5000

*Counsel for Official Committee of Unsecured  
Creditors of Arcapita Bank B.S.C.(c), et al.*

**Exhibit A**

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.00200 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/ASSET SALES**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16425900 9/1/2013	Numerous emails and calls internally, with TPG, with Debtors regarding Eurolog sale.	3.70	Fleck, Evan R.
16437837 9/1/2013	All parties call (1.3); communications with E. Fleck and Houlihan Lokey (2.0); telephone call with [REDACTED] (1.3); teleconference with Zodiac home side (1.0); finalise points from all parties call (1.0); review tax issues identified by Linklaters on the Share Purchase Agreement (2.0).	8.60	Stamp, Mark
16461759 9/1/2013	Review revised draft SPA for Eurolog assets (.6); corresp. w/ E. Fleck re same (.3).	0.90	Lee, Roger
16444682 9/1/2013	Review revised SPA (1.1); contact with M. Mortimer re outstanding tax issues (.8); internal communications re [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (.8); attend conference call with Linklaters and Gibson Dunn to update Linklaters on outcome of discussions/contact with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (1.0); attend all parties conference call re [REDACTED] (1.3); changes to SPA conditions and consequential changes to SPA (1.1); prepare summary of principal pre-completion obligations (.9).	7.00	Altay, Merih O.
16425898 9/1/2013	Review emails with board re sale of Eurolog assets.	0.40	Ulvad, Greta R.
16426910 9/1/2013	Review of revised version of SPA and tax issues lists (1.7); discussion with Linklaters tax partner re same (.4); discussions M. Altay (.8); review of documentation (1.7); email of advice re same (.9).	5.50	Mortimer, Matthew
16425901 9/2/2013	Continued work on Eurolog transaction.	4.70	Fleck, Evan R.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.00200 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/ASSET SALES**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16437838 9/2/2013	All parties call (1.5); co-ordinate with E. Fleck regarding Share Purchase Agreement and Issues list and emails (0.3); review Share Purchase Agreement (4.5); call with Linklaters regarding Share Purchase Agreement (3.00); call with TPG (1.3); draft Share Purchase Agreement amendments (2.0); all parties meeting at Freshfields (4.0).	16.60	Stamp, Mark
16461760 9/2/2013	Review prior UCC correspondence re Eurolog assets (1.0); draft UCC email re Eurolog approval (1.9); corresp. w/ M. Altay re SPA status (.3); revise UCC email and circulate internally (.3); corresp. w/ M. Altay re Eurolog holding structure (.3); revise UCC email re Eurolog (.5); corresp. w/ E. Fleck and G. Ulvad re same (.6); review draft Eurolog motion (1.7).	6.60	Lee, Roger
16444683 9/2/2013	Review revised SPA and internal communications with M. Mortimer and M. Stamp re outstanding issues (1.1); conference call with Linklaters re open issues/ SPA (1.5); coordinate SPA review with NY (.2); follow up with E. Fleck re pre-completion issues and potential Arcapita liability (.5); review comments/queries re SPA received from RAH board/ UCC and prepare suggested response (2.0); attend all-parties meeting re SPA and other open issues at Freshfields (4.0); update communications with E Fleck and Houlihan Lokey (.5); page-turn of SPA with Linklaters (3.0); prepare update email re SPA discussions (.4); follow-up with Linklaters re potential German corporate income tax and trade tax and Luxembourg withholding tax issues (.5); correspondence with E Fleck re TPG waiver of RAH ratification condition (.4); review and comment on draft UCC email for Eurolog approval (.2); prepare manuscript mark-up of revised SPA (1.1).	15.40	Altay, Merih O.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.00200 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/ASSET SALES**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16425899 9/2/2013	Revise and circulate email re sale of Eurolog assets (.2); emails E. Fleck and R. Lee re same (.1).	0.30	Ulvad, Greta R.
16426915 9/2/2013	Review of revised version of SPA and tax issues lists (1.6); discussions with Linklaters tax partner (1.0); communications with M. Altay and M. Stamp (1.2); review of documentation (1.9); emails of advice (2.0); all parties meeting at FBD offices (4.0); preparation of issues list (.8).	12.50	Mortimer, Matthew
16425902 9/3/2013	Continued work on matters with respect to Eurolog transaction, including client calls, board communications, advisor meetings and revisions to documents.	5.20	Fleck, Evan R.
16425903 9/3/2013	Review Eurolog sale and [REDACTED].	0.60	Dunne, Dennis F.
16437839 9/3/2013	Review revised Share Purchase Agreement (5.0); internal communications with E. Fleck and M. Altay (2.0); meeting at Linklaters with [REDACTED] (6.3).	13.30	Stamp, Mark
16461761 9/3/2013	Review updated draft Eurolog SPA (.5); review corresp. from M. Altay re same (1.0); review [REDACTED] (.9); corresp. w/ E. Fleck re same (.6); c/c w/ GDC (M. Rosenthal, J. Graves), MTHM, Linklaters re SPA and motion (.3); review Eurolog motion (.6); corresp. w/ E. Fleck re same (.8); call w/ J. Graves re SPA condition (.1); call w/ M. Altay re open issues (.5); revise SPA re same (.4); further corresp. w/ J. Graves and M. Altay re same (.4); t/c w/ M. Altay re SPA issues (.6); corresp. w/ MTHM team re motion timing requirements (.3); additional corresp. w/ J. Graves re Eurolog issues (.3); corresp. w/ MTHM team re DIP security issue (.4); review updated Eurolog motion (1.9).	9.60	Lee, Roger

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.00200 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/ASSET SALES**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16444684 9/3/2013	Review revised SPA (.4); internal communications with M. Stamp and M. Mortimer re same (.5); conference with Linklaters re revised SPA and outstanding issues (.9); review further revised SPA (.4); correspondence with Houlihan re Leakage mechanics (.5); circulate SPA mark-up to Linklaters (.2); calls with R. Lee re bankruptcy comments/input on SPA (1.1); correspondence with E Fleck re SPA conditions (.3); attend all parties meeting at Linklaters to finalise SPA and resolve outstanding issues (6.3); revise SPA and review numerous revised versions (1.3); internal communications re final outstanding issues (.6).	12.70	Altay, Merih O.
16437282 9/3/2013	Review emails with Committee re sale of Eurolog assets (.1); email UCC member re same (.1).	0.20	Ulvad, Greta R.
16426916 9/3/2013	Review of revised version of SPA and tax issues lists and correspondence (1.5); discussions with Linklaters tax partner (1.0); communications with Milbank lawyers (1.2); review of documentation (1.3); emails of advice (1.2); document completion meeting at Linklaters offices (6.3).	12.50	Mortimer, Matthew
16479809 9/3/2013	Review draft EuroLog motion (.4); communications with E. Fleck re same (.1).	0.50	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16443650 9/3/2013	Review KPMG's revised hold harmless proposal in respect of their report (2.2); liaise with NY office for approval of approach to avoid the need for a further hold harmless (1.1).	3.00	Wayte, Daniel J.
16421783 9/3/2013	Review correspondence re sale of Eurolog assets.	0.30	Mandel, Lena
16437840 9/4/2013	Review revised draft of Share Purchase Agreement (3.0); internal communications with E. Fleck (1.3).	4.30	Stamp, Mark



**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.00200 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/ASSET SALES**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16461762 9/4/2013	Corresp. w/ E. Fleck and GDC re Eurolog motion comments (.1); review related draft declaration (.7); draft update to UCC re Eurolog (.5); corresp. w/ GDC re open issues on Eurolog motion (.2).	1.50	Lee, Roger
16444685 9/4/2013	Attend all parties meeting at Linklaters to finalise SPA and resolve outstanding issues (4.0); revise SPA and review numerous revised versions (3.8); discussions with Linklaters (2.1); internal discussions re final outstanding issues (.9).	10.80	Altay, Merih O.
16437283 9/4/2013	Prepare email to UCC re sale of Eurolog assets (.2); comm. E. Fleck and R. Lee re same (.1); revise and circulate same (.1).	0.40	Ulvad, Greta R.
16426917 9/4/2013	Communications with M. Altay re status.	0.50	Mortimer, Matthew
16459057 9/4/2013	Communications with Barclays re hold harmless letter (.1); communications with E. Fleck re same (.1); communications with A. Everett re fixed assets purchase agreement (.3); review same (.2).	0.70	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16444687 9/4/2013	Review KPMG's revised hold harmless proposal in respect of their report and liaising with NY office for approval of approach to avoid the need for a further hold harmless.	3.30	Wayte, Daniel J.
16461763 9/5/2013	Corresp. w/ M. Stamp and J. Graves (GDC) re Eurolog motion timing (.4); review finalized Eurolog SPA (1.2); corresp. w/ M. Altay re Eurolog motion (.1); provide comments re same (.6); corresp. w/ E. Fleck re same (.5); corresp. w/ M. Bouslog (GDC) re same (.2); review updated Eurolog motion (.7); corresp. w/ E. Fleck and M. Bouslog re same (.2).	3.90	Lee, Roger

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.00200 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/ASSET SALES**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16444686 9/5/2013	Contact with NY re SPA and court motion (.2); review draft motion and providing suggested comments/ mark-up to NY (2.1); contact with Linklaters re status of conditions (.3); summary of potential warranty and indemnity claims (2.0).	4.60	Altay, Merih O.
16461764 9/6/2013	Corresp. w/ M. Altay, G. Ulvad, A. Tsang re timing of Eurolog motion/hearing.	0.60	Lee, Roger
16476118 9/6/2013	Contact with NY re SPA and court motion; contact with Linklaters re status of conditions;	0.50	Altay, Merih O.
16469459 9/9/2013	Call to discuss MSA.	1.00	Stamp, Mark
16461765 9/9/2013	Corresp. w/ E. Fleck and A. Davey (HL) re ratification issues for Eurolog.	0.20	Lee, Roger
16460353 9/9/2013	Contact with Linklaters re status of SPA conditions and update NY team re same (0.2); attend call re [REDACTED] (1); further contact with Linklaters re SPA completion (0.2).	1.40	Altay, Merih O.
16443621 9/9/2013	Review emails re eurolog closing.	0.30	Friedman, Bradley S.
16461766 9/10/2013	Corresp. w/ E. Fleck, M. Altay, A. Davey (HL) re Eurolog proceeds waterfall projections.	0.60	Lee, Roger
16460354 9/10/2013	Follow-up contact with Linklaters re SPA conditions and update to NY team (0.2); internal communications with NY re distribution of proceeds (0.2); review [REDACTED] (0.8).	1.20	Altay, Merih O.
16449092 9/10/2013	Communications re Eurolog Sale.	0.40	Harris, Jennifer P.
16447639 9/11/2013	Call with new board and HL regarding Eurolog sale.	0.80	Fleck, Evan R.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.00200 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/ASSET SALES**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16469461 9/11/2013	RA call regarding [REDACTED] (.8); discussions with Director (1.5); review of board minutes for satisfaction of condition, internal discussions (1.1); review [REDACTED] (.9); discussion with Linklaters on [REDACTED] (1.0).	5.30	Stamp, Mark
16469531 9/11/2013	Corresp. w/ G. Ulvad re Eurolog notes for call w/ D. Burlison (future RA board) (.4); revise same (.3); attend same call (.8).	1.50	Lee, Roger
16460355 9/11/2013	Contact with Linklaters re [REDACTED].	0.50	Altay, Merih O.
16447638 9/11/2013	Prepare Eurolog talking points (.6); comm. R. Lee re same (.3).	0.90	Ulvad, Greta R.
16469462 9/12/2013	Comm. with Evan Fleck (0.8); review of revised tax note (0.8); review lease arrangements (0.50).	2.10	Stamp, Mark
16460356 9/12/2013	Consider tax table, internal discussions and contact with Linklaters re same (1.0); contact with Linklaters re SPA conditions (0.2).	1.20	Altay, Merih O.
16452964 9/12/2013	Research issue re Eurolog settlements (.1); corresp with HL team re same (.1).	0.20	Friedman, Bradley S.
16460358 9/12/2013	Review of Linklaters table (.3); communications with M. Altay and associated review of SPA (1.0).	1.30	Mortimer, Matthew
16461768 9/13/2013	Corresp. w/ M. Altay and MTHM corporate team re RA ratification for Eurolog sale.	0.70	Lee, Roger
16460357 9/13/2013	Contact with Linklaters and NY team re [REDACTED] (0.4); review Houlihan Lokey proceeds summary slides (0.4); contact with Linklaters re tax table and reviewing changes to SPA since board note was prepared (1.0).	1.80	Altay, Merih O.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.00200 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/ASSET SALES**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16460359 9/13/2013	Reseach and emails re advice.	1.80	Mortimer, Matthew
16461769 9/15/2013	Review draft HL deck to RA board re Eurolog (.3); review draft reply to future RA board member's questions re Eurolog (.4); review changes to same HL deck (.3).	1.00	Lee, Roger
16469463 9/16/2013	Discussion internally on Eurolog Sale (1.5); review of Houlihan Lokey Slides plus comments (1.00).	2.50	Stamp, Mark
16469456 9/16/2013	Review multiple iterations of HL presentation re Eurolog and provide comments/mark-ups to HL (1.6); contact with Linklaters and KPMG re wiring instructions (0.2); t/c with Linklaters re tax (0.2); t/c and email correspondence with KPMG re tax table (0.3).	2.30	Altay, Merih O.
16465803 9/16/2013	Review correspondence re approval requirements.	0.50	Wayte, Daniel J.
16469464 9/17/2013	Agree on final version of the note (0.8), discussions on [REDACTED] (1.00).	1.80	Stamp, Mark
16469458 9/17/2013	Review KPMG comments on [REDACTED] (1.5); further calls with Linklaters re tax table and further revising tax table (1); further contact with KPMG re tax table (0.1); finalise tax table (0.2); follow-up with Linklaters re closing conditions/ deliverables (0.1); attend call with HL and RA board member re Eurolog transaction (0.6); internal contact with R. Lee re contribution agreement and respond to Linklaters queries re same (0.4).	3.90	Altay, Merih O.
16476119 9/17/2013	Review of tax table. Input into tax table. Checking amendments.	1.30	Mortimer, Matthew

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.00400 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/BAHRAIN ISSUES**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16425904 9/2/2013	Internal communications re Forms 3s.	0.10	Ulvad, Greta R.
16447640 9/4/2013	Corrs. w/ internal team re CBB forms.	0.30	Tsang, Andrew C.
16447641 9/5/2013	Corrs. w/ internal team re CBB forms.	0.20	Tsang, Andrew C.
16437284 9/5/2013	Prepare chart re status of CBB Form 3s (.4); comm. N. Kamphaus re same (.2); emails E. Fleck re same (.1); email directors re same (.6); emails E. Fleck re same (.2).	1.50	Ulvad, Greta R.
16443656 9/5/2013	Review status of CBB forms (.3); review communications re same (.2); communications with G. Ulvad re same (.3); communications with E. Fleck re same (.1).	0.90	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16437285 9/6/2013	Comm. E. Fleck and Debtors re Form 3s (.2); call A. Doshi (Arcapita) re same (.1); email directors re same (.5).	0.80	Ulvad, Greta R.
16465774 9/16/2013	Call director re Form 3 status.	0.10	Ulvad, Greta R.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.00600 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CASH MANAGEMENT**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16479810 9/3/2013	Communications with P. Topper (FTI) re [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED].	0.20	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16479811 9/4/2013	Review issues re [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (.2); communications with P. Topper (FTI) re same (.2).	0.40	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.00800 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CLAIMS ANALYSIS AND ESTIMATION**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16447642 9/4/2013	Comm. w/ N. Kamphaus re claims forms (.2); draft same (1.5); corrs. w/ N. Kamphaus re same (.1); revise same (.2).	2.00	Tsang, Andrew C.
16459826 9/9/2013	Research re 502(d) omnibus objection (.7); corrs. w/ N. Kamphaus re same (.3).	1.00	Tsang, Andrew C.
16459059 9/9/2013	Communications with J. Weisser (Gibson Dunn) re claims issues.	0.20	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16459827 9/10/2013	Research re omnibus objection.	0.50	Tsang, Andrew C.
16445217 9/10/2013	Communications with E. Fleck and N. Kamphaus re claims reconciliation process.	0.40	Mandel, Lena
16459828 9/11/2013	Corrs. w/ N. Kamphaus re omnibus objection (.2); comm. w/ L. Mandel re same (.3); corrs. w/ FTI re same (.3); research re same (1.9); begin draft of omnibus objection (2.1); corrs. w/ K. Glowacki (Gibson Dunn) re same (.2).	5.00	Tsang, Andrew C.
16479812 9/11/2013	Review proposed claims stipulation (.4); communications with FTI re same (.2); communications with E. Fleck re same (.2); conference with L. Mandel and A. Tsang re claims objection issues (.5); review 502(d) objection issues (.4); communications with A. Tsang re same (.3).	2.00	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16447016 9/11/2013	Communications with N. Kamphaus re claims reconciliation status (.3); review A&M printouts re same (1.5); communications with A. Tsang re section 502(d) objection (.2).	2.00	Mandel, Lena
16459829 9/12/2013	Continue draft of omnibus objection (2.9); corrs. w/ internal team re same (.6); corrs. w/ K. Glowacki (Gibson Dunn) and W. Ng (FTI) re same (.4); research re same (2.1); comm. w/ B. Friedman re same (.2).	6.20	Tsang, Andrew C.
16453011 9/12/2013	Corresp with A. Tsang re 502(d) issues.	0.60	Friedman, Bradley S.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.00800 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CLAIMS ANALYSIS AND ESTIMATION**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16479813 9/12/2013	Review L. Mandel comments to claims stipulation (.5); communications with Gibson Dunn re same (.2).	0.70	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16449753 9/12/2013	Review and markup stipulation resolving objection to claims (1.2); review materials relating to response to 5th omnibus objection to claims (.8).	2.00	Mandel, Lena
16459830 9/13/2013	Revise 502(d) omnibus objection (1.7); corrs. w/ L. Mandel re same (.4); corrs. w/ FTI re same (.2); call w/ FTI and A&M re same (.4); revise [REDACTED] (.3); corrs. w/ N. Kamphaus re same (.2).	3.20	Tsang, Andrew C.
16479814 9/13/2013	Review document production requests (.7); communications with L. Mandel re same and related claims objection (.4); communications with A. Leblanc re same (.4).	1.50	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16451081 9/13/2013	Communications with N. Kamphause re claims reconciliation matters (.5); comm. with A. Leblanc and Gibson re same (.8); analyze further steps (.7).	2.00	Mandel, Lena
16459831 9/14/2013	Revise omnibus objection.	0.80	Tsang, Andrew C.
16459058 9/16/2013	Corrs. w/ S. Kotarba (A&M) re claims (.2); review email from S. Kotarba re same (.2).	0.40	Tsang, Andrew C.
16479815 9/16/2013	Review discovery requests from claimant (.4); communications with L. Mandel and P. Marecki re same (.5); communications with B. Kim (Gibson Dunn) re pending claims objection (.3); call with attorney for claimant and P. Marecki re claims issues (.5); follow-up communications with P. Marecki and L. Mandel re same (.3); review omnibus claims objection filed by Gibson Dunn (.6); communications with L. Mandel re same (.3); communications with E. Fleck re same (.2).	3.10	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.



**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.00800 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CLAIMS ANALYSIS AND ESTIMATION**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16455181 9/16/2013	Correspond with team members re status (.2); comm. with P. Marecki re [REDACTED] (.2); review Sixth omnibus claims objection (.2); correspond with team re same (.2).	0.80	Mandel, Lena
16459832 9/17/2013	Communications with L. Mandel and P. Marecki re claims reconciliation process (.3); call with claimant re details of claim (.2).	0.50	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16460613 9/17/2013	Correspond with team members re status of various objections to claims (.3); review and revise section 502(d) objection (1.9); communications with A. Tsang re same (.3).	2.50	Mandel, Lena

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.00900 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16466492 9/2/2013	Review materials and email correspondence circulated by G. Ulvad to the creditors committee.	0.10	Dewar, John R.
16444693 9/3/2013	Review materials circulated to the creditors' committee by G. Ulvad.	0.20	Dewar, John R.
16437286 9/3/2013	Correspond with internal team re administrative matters.	0.30	Ulvad, Greta R.
16437287 9/4/2013	Comm. A. Heckman re UCC member expense reimbursement (.1); review re same (.2); call S. Fuller (A&M) re same (.2); email UCC member re same (.1); emails S. Fuller re same (.1).	0.70	Ulvad, Greta R.
16440067 9/4/2013	Review news alerts.	0.10	Kazi, Rohan S.
16444694 9/5/2013	Review email correspondence to the Committee from G. Ulvad.	0.10	Dewar, John R.
16437288 9/5/2013	Correspond with internal team re administrative matters.	0.60	Ulvad, Greta R.
16447643 9/6/2013	Revise critical dates calendar (.4); corrs. w/ internal team re same (.3).	0.70	Tsang, Andrew C.
16437289 9/6/2013	Correspond with internal team re administrative matters (.5); calendar plan timeline dates for internal team (.2); prepare weekly email to UCC (.3); comm. A. Tsang, R. Lee and N. Kamphaus re calendaring issues (.3); revise and circulate email to UCC (.3).	1.60	Ulvad, Greta R.
16444695 9/7/2013	Review filing updates circulated by A. Tsang and G. Ulvad.	0.40	Dewar, John R.
16437291 9/8/2013	Respond to case correspondence.	0.40	Fleck, Evan R.
16437290 9/8/2013	Correspond with internal team re administrative matters.	0.30	Ulvad, Greta R.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.00900 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16469521 9/9/2013	Attend portion of advisors call.	0.60	Everett li, Andrew H.
16447644 9/9/2013	Correspond with internal team re administrative matters.	0.70	Ulvad, Greta R.
16477272 9/9/2013	Professionals' call (.8); comm. w E. Fleck re various issues (.7).	1.50	Newman, Peter
16469520 9/9/2013	Attend advisors' call.	0.80	Ebberson, James K.
16479816 9/9/2013	Participate on advisors call (.8); prepare for same (.2); communications with G. Ulvad and team re administrative matters (.7).	1.70	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16469522 9/9/2013	Attend advisor call.	0.80	Shah, Kim M.
16455008 9/9/2013	Review daily news alerts.	0.10	Kazi, Rohan S.
16459834 9/10/2013	Draft billing categories for RA matters (.5); corrs. w/ N. Kamphaus re same (.3).	0.80	Tsang, Andrew C.
16447645 9/10/2013	Correspond with internal team re administrative matters.	0.60	Ulvad, Greta R.
16479817 9/10/2013	Communications with internal team re administrative matters in connection with effective date transition.	0.20	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16452965 9/12/2013	Correspond with internal team re administrative matters.	0.30	Ulvad, Greta R.
16455011 9/12/2013	Review daily news alerts.	0.10	Kazi, Rohan S.
16461920 9/13/2013	Work on NCM and related issues.	1.00	Lee, Roger
16459060 9/13/2013	Revise critical dates calendar (.2); corrs. w/ internal team re same (.1); corrs. w/ internal team re open issues (.3).	0.60	Tsang, Andrew C.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.00900 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/COMMITTEE ADMINISTRATION**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16452966 9/13/2013	Prepare weekly email to UCC (.1); emails FAs re same (.1); emails A. Stine re same (.1); emails E. Fleck re same (.1); revise and circulate same (.2); correspond with internal team re administrative matters (.6).	1.20	Ulvad, Greta R.
16461921 9/15/2013	Revisions to NCM and corresp. re same.	0.50	Lee, Roger
16459061 9/16/2013	Corrs. w/ G. Ulvad re open issues (.2); review filed pleadings (.2); corrs. w/ internal team re same (.1).	0.50	Tsang, Andrew C.
16465782 9/16/2013	Email FAs re MOR (.1); email UCC member re expense reimbursement (.1); correspond with internal team re administrative matters (.6).	0.80	Ulvad, Greta R.
16479818 9/16/2013	Communications with corporate team re administrative materials for closing; communications with G. Ulvad re administrative matters for effective date transition.	0.70	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16470416 9/16/2013	Multiple corresps. with P. Marecki re requested claims objections pleadings (.1); search court dockets and circulate findings (.2); review daily news alerts (.1).	0.40	Kazi, Rohan S.
16465783 9/17/2013	Emails UCC member re expense reimbursement (.1); correspond with internal team re administrative matters (.6).	0.70	Ulvad, Greta R.
16459835 9/17/2013	Communications with E. Fleck, G. Ulvad, and A. Tsang re case management procedures going forward (1.7); draft and revise notice of appearance and notice canceling omnibus hearing (.5); communications with court re same (.3); communications with Gibson Dunn re case management procedures going forward (.5).	3.30	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16470417 9/17/2013	Review daily news alerts.	0.10	Kazi, Rohan S.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01000 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/COMMITTEE MEETINGS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16479820 9/1/2013	Draft email response re items for discussion at Committee meeting (.9); communications with R. Lee re same (.3); communications with E. Fleck re same (.3); communications with N. Bassett re same (.2).	1.70	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16437292 9/5/2013	Email FAs re Tuesday's UCC call agenda.	0.10	Ulvad, Greta R.
16437293 9/6/2013	Prepare UCC call agenda.	0.10	Ulvad, Greta R.
16437294 9/7/2013	Emails. E. Fleck re 9-10 UCC call agenda (.2); revisions to same (.2).	0.40	Ulvad, Greta R.
16437296 9/8/2013	Calls with UCC members re: effective date (.7); review/revise materials for committee call (.9).	1.60	Fleck, Evan R.
16437295 9/8/2013	Emails internally and with FAs re Tuesday's call (.1); revise agenda for same (.2).	0.30	Ulvad, Greta R.
16449520 9/9/2013	Review materials circulated by G. Ulvad for creditors committee call.	0.40	Dewar, John R.
16447647 9/9/2013	Prepare email to UCC with tomorrow's call materials (.2); comm. E. Fleck re same (.1); revise and circulate same (.2); prepare materials (.4); calendar and schedule additional UCC call (.3); prepare further UCC call materials email (.2); comm. E. Fleck re same (.1); revise and circulate same (.2).	1.70	Ulvad, Greta R.
16459064 9/9/2013	Participate on chair call.	0.70	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16469523 9/9/2013	Attend call with chair.	0.70	Shah, Kim M.
16452967 9/10/2013	Participate on committee call.	1.10	Fleck, Evan R.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01000 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/COMMITTEE MEETINGS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16449521 9/10/2013	Attend Creditors' committee conference call (1.1); review materials circulated by G. Ulvad to the creditors' committee in preparation for same (0.3).	1.40	Dewar, John R.
16446009 9/10/2013	Attend committee call (partial).	0.60	Dunne, Dennis F.
16469525 9/10/2013	Attend Arcapita Committee call.	1.10	Janson, Thomas C.
16469527 9/10/2013	Prep for (.2) and participate in (1.1) call with UCC.	1.30	Morgan, Jane E.
16469460 9/10/2013	Attend Committee call.	1.00	Stamp, Mark
16459063 9/10/2013	Prepare for Committee call (.2); draft open issues email to internal team re same (.5).	0.70	Tsang, Andrew C.
16447648 9/10/2013	Prepare for/coordinate re today's UCC call.	1.00	Ulvad, Greta R.
16447649 9/11/2013	Prepare materials for tomorrow's call (.2); prepare email to UCC with same (.2); comm. E. Fleck and FAs re same (.3); revise and circulate UCC email (.1).	0.80	Ulvad, Greta R.
16449073 9/12/2013	Prepare for committee call (.3); participate on same (1.0).	1.30	Fleck, Evan R.
16449522 9/12/2013	Attend teleconference with Creditors Committee (1.0), review materials circulated to the Committee (0.3).	1.30	Dewar, John R.
16452968 9/12/2013	Attend committee call re closing items (partial).	0.40	Dunne, Dennis F.
16469536 9/12/2013	Attend Committee conference call.	1.00	Janson, Thomas C.
16449074 9/12/2013	Participate in call with UCC to review final terms of MSA (1.0); prep for questions received [REDACTED] (.3).	1.30	Morgan, Jane E.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01000 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/COMMITTEE MEETINGS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16447650 9/12/2013	Prepare for/coordinate re today's UCC call (.6); prepare and circulate open issues email re same (.1).	0.70	Ulvad, Greta R.
16465786 9/16/2013	Coordinate re UCC call cancellation.	0.10	Ulvad, Greta R.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01200 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/COMMUNICATIONS WITH CREDITORS & WEBSITE**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16437297 9/3/2013	Review and coordinate re updates to UCC website (.6); comm. N. Kamphaus re same (.1).	0.70	Ulvad, Greta R.
16479821 9/3/2013	Calls with creditors re status of cases.	0.40	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16447652 9/5/2013	Corrs. w/ R. Kazi re monthly reports (.2); review re same (.1).	0.30	Tsang, Andrew C.
16459066 9/11/2013	Draft email to creditor re timing of distributions (.4); communications with E. Fleck re same (.1).	0.50	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16470421 9/17/2013	Continue consolidating materials for (.4) and drafting (2.3) monthly report.	2.70	Kazi, Rohan S.



**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16425905 9/1/2013	Review correspondence re: closing items.	0.10	Everett li, Andrew H.
16425909 9/1/2013	Review and revise transaction documents, create PDF signatures pages thereto and circulate to GDC.	2.00	Stine, Aaron
16426926 9/1/2013	Emails with J. Morgan in relation to signing and closing of the Sukuk.	0.40	Hussain, Munib
16444688 9/2/2013	Review email correspondence relating to the Mudwaba sukuk.	0.20	Dewar, John R.
16425922 9/2/2013	Review and comment on draft of transition an indemnification agreement (1.3); calls and notes re same (.5).	1.80	Morgan, Jane E.
16425906 9/2/2013	Correspondence re: status of financing documents (0.5); review correspondence re: closing items (0.7); review HQ shareholders agreement (1.0); draft issues list re: same (0.3); correspondence with D. Wayte re: ██████████ (0.1); review correspondence re: ancillary closing documents (0.3).	2.90	Everett li, Andrew H.
16425908 9/2/2013	Call Soundpath re 9/17 board call (.1); emails with E. Fleck re same (.1); comm. A. Stine re and prepare director info (.3).	0.50	Ulvad, Greta R.
16425910 9/2/2013	Review and revise transaction documents, create PDF signatures pages thereto and circulate to GDC (2.1); revise Transition and Indemnification Agreement and circulate (0.6); revise ██████████ (0.2).	2.90	Stine, Aaron

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16426927 9/2/2013	Review and respond to email from K. Shah in relation to execution of documents (1.20); emails to E. Khalil (Gibson) in relation the Restricted Subsidiary list to be included in the Mudaraba Agreement (0.20); emails to schedule a Milbank call to discuss closing process (0.30); review email from Hogan Lovells re comments from BIL and communication re same with J. Jackson (1.00).	2.70	Hussain, Munib
16479824 9/2/2013	Review materials in connection with information for new Singapore director candidate (.5); communications with E. Fleck re same (.1); communicate with director candidate re same (.3).	0.90	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16426929 9/2/2013	Research, consider and provide feedback in respect of English law execution queries.	1.50	Cox, Vicky L.
16463622 9/3/2013	Call w/exit finance team to review open issues and proposed timing for exit and implementation of step plan and satisfaction of c.p.'s re same (.7) review issues w/A. Everett and A. Stine (.4); calls and notes re revisions to board comp plan and grant agreements (.8); discuss process for review of proposed leases of space to AIM and third party tenants w/A. Everett (.7); calls and notes re [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (.6).	3.20	Morgan, Jane E.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16425755 9/3/2013	Correspondence with FTI re: asset transfer agmt (0.2); review ██████████ (0.4); correspondence with E. Fleck re: same (0.2); revise ██████████ (0.6); correspondence with GDC re: same (0.1); t/c with GDC re: asset transfer agmt (0.2); communications with A. Stine and J. Morgan re: same and open items (0.4); t/c with Milbank finance team re: exit facility closing (0.7); review closing checklist re: same (0.1); o/c with A. Kurtich and A. Stine re: closing mechanics (0.3); review revised shareholders agreements (0.7); tvn to C. Babcock (GDC) re: signature pages (0.1).	4.00	Everett li, Andrew H.
16425911 9/3/2013	Meeting with A. Everett and A. Kurtich re workstreams (0.3); call with J. O'Grady (GDC) regarding closing logistics and related questions (0.5); communications with internal corporate re status (0.7); call with J. Harris and J. Fish regarding closing logistics for the exit facility (0.7); revise resolutions (1.5); revise index of closing documents (0.5); review, respond to and draft emails (1.2); finalize AST transfer agent agreement (0.5); finalize Barclays board observer rights letter (0.4); continue creating transaction documents signature page packet (1.4).	7.70	Stine, Aaron
16426928 9/3/2013	Review Sukuk Documents in order to finalise the same (1.50); prepare notices of assignment in relation to Sukuk (0.90); participate in call with Wilmington Trust (US) and Bank Luxembourg to discuss Sukuk Certificate distributions (0.80); attend to follow-up emails with Bank Luxembourg and N. Kamphaus (0.70).	3.90	Hussain, Munib
16437300 9/3/2013	Review of resolutions to update closing index (1.8); meeting with A. Stine and A. Everett regarding future assignments (.3).	2.10	Kurtich, Amy

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16479825 9/3/2013	Revise distribution procedures memo; communications with corporate team re same; communications with FTI re same; communications with Committee chair re execution of documents.	3.40	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16444699 9/3/2013	Conf call w/ listing agent re financials (.8); comm. re financial requirements w/ N. Kamphaus (.9); emails re same (.6).	2.30	Jackson, Jonathon
16444689 9/4/2013	Review email correspondence relating to the Mudarabah sukuk (0.3); attend conference call with MTHM New York and M. Hussain to discuss closing process for the sukuk (0.5); review comments on sukuk documents and sukuk related documentation issues (0.4).	1.20	Dewar, John R.
16463623 9/4/2013	Call w/Sukuk team to discuss open issues and proposed timing for exit from bankruptcy and closing logistics (.5); calls and notes re need to deliver insurance certificate as part of exit facility and continuation of coverage post E.D. (1.2); discuss revisions to RA board incentive plan and grant letters (1.1)	2.80	Morgan, Jane E.
16477267 9/4/2013	Numerous calls and notes re London and Atlanta leases and issues related to secondment of employees (1.8); discuss issues re proposed scope of T&I Agreement (1.3).	3.10	Morgan, Jane E.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16425907 9/4/2013	T/c with M. Hussain and J. Dewar, re: closing mechanics (0.5); correspondence with Latham re: shareholders agreements (1.2); review shareholders agreements (1.0); correspondence with J. Fish re: closing mechanics (0.8); t/c with GDC re: same (0.4); communications with N. Kamphaus re: asset transfers (0.4); correspondence with A. Kurtich re: same (0.5); t/c with W. Ng (FTI) re: schedules (0.4); correspondence with A. Stine re: resolutions (0.5); correspondence re: Singapore director (0.2); review HQ shareholders agreement terms (0.8); draft issues list re: same (1.5); communications with J. Morgan re: open items (0.4).	8.60	Everett li, Andrew H.
16446013 9/4/2013	Further discuss Arcaptia leases with A. Everett (.4); follow-up email correspondence with Bahrain counsel (.2); continue reviewing ██████████ (.6).	1.20	Dworkis, Hannah
16431949 9/4/2013	Call with GDC regarding shari'ah services agreement (0.2); call with GDC regarding exit facility (0.5); call with GDC regarding indemnification agreement (0.4); internal communications regarding insurance, indemnification agreement and Singapore director (0.5); correspondence with J. Morgan (1.4); call with GDC regarding Services Agreement (0.5); communications with J. Fish regarding exit facility (0.4); draft and revise resolutions (4.5); revise step plan documents sent by GDC (1.0); review, respond to and draft emails (1.2); continue creating transaction documents signature page packet (1.0); revise indemnification agreement (0.4); review and revise services agreement (0.8); create individualized Director award incentive agreements (0.4).	13.20	Stine, Aaron

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16446272 9/4/2013	Update Signing Checklist and the Declaration of Trust to include reference to issuance of the Fatwa (0.60); update list of Restricted Subsidiaries in the Mudaraba Agreement based on latest list received from Gibson Dunn (1.10); emails on Restricted Subsidiary reconciliation with Gibson Dunn (0.90); prepare notices and assignment and acknowledgments for the Sukuk Documents (1.30); teleconference with E. Khalil (Gibson) and related emails in relation to issuance of Fatwa (1.80); continue to finalise the Sukuk Documents (1.70); call with E. Khalil re appointment of Mourants as Cayman counsel post the Effective Date (0.30); call with J. Dewar and NY corporate in relation to closing process (0.50).	8.20	Hussain, Munib
16443639 9/4/2013	Review employee provisions in documents (1.0); communications w/ M. Hussain and J. Morgan re: signatories (.5); correspondence re: signatories to documents (1.0); correspondence re call w/ Gibson team re: executing documents (.7).	3.20	Fish, Julia E.
16425915 9/4/2013	Correspondence w/ A. Stine re: board resolutions (.6); review board resolutions for changing directors (.9).	1.50	Ebberson, James K.
16437301 9/4/2013	Review of contracts for ATA (.8); draft of board resolutions for exit facility (.6); review of insurance contracts for transfer provisions (1.2).	2.60	Kurtich, Amy
16479826 9/4/2013	Call with Committee member and Committee advisors re distribution procedures; prepare for same; revise presentation in connection with same; review materials in connection with Singapore assets; communications with potential director re same; communications with E. Fleck re same.	3.80	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16425923 9/4/2013	Comunciations with E. Fleck, J. Morgan, A Everett and A. Stine regarding D&O, transition, Eurolog signing (0.5); communications with J. Morgan re insurance issues, D&O, comp plan and financing documents (1.5).	2.00	Shah, Kim M.
16444700 9/4/2013	Emails re sukuk docs.	0.50	Jackson, Jonathon
16444690 9/5/2013	Review email correspondence regarding Mudaraba sukuk issues (0.2); review Mudaraba sukuk documentation (0.4); communications with M. Hussain (0.1).	0.70	Dewar, John R.
16463624 9/5/2013	Numerous calls and notes re issues in RA board comp and grant agreements (1.3); calls and notes re legal opinions to be delivered in connection w/Sukuk transaction and exit facilities (1.2); calls and notes re CBB process and Form 3's for new proposed Arcapita Bank directors including revised notice and proxy (1.4); review IRS notice and notes re same (.5)	4.40	Morgan, Jane E.
16431948 9/5/2013	Review step plan and employee background materials (0.9); correspondence with J. Fish re: employee salary obligations (0.6); t/c with A. Stine and K. Shah re: asset transfers (0.8); review ██████████ (0.4); revise shareholders agreement (0.8); correspondence with E. Fleck re: same (0.1); revise asset transfer agreement (0.7); correspondence with J. Morgan and A. Stine re: open items (0.5); t/c with finance team re: exit facility (0.7); review cash flow mechanics for RA (0.8); t/c with W. Ng (FTI) re: asset transfers (0.3); t/c with W. Ng (FTI) re: employees (0.3); correspondence with A. Stine re: signature pages (0.2); correspondence with N. Kamphaus re: Arcapita employees (0.2).	7.30	Everett li, Andrew H.
16437299 9/5/2013	Schedule audit committee call (.1); comm. E. Fleck re same (.1).	0.20	Ulvad, Greta R.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16433854 9/5/2013	Revise shari'ah services agreement (0.3); call with GDC regarding exit facility (0.7); internal corporate communications re status (0.8); correspondence with J. Fish regarding exit facility (0.3); draft and revise resolutions (4.5); call with K. Shah and A. Everett re asset transfers (0.8); review, respond to and draft emails (0.7); continue creating resolutions signature page packet (1.5); revise Incentive Plan and Incentive Award Agreement (1.2); call with Walkers regarding Cayman law (0.2).	11.00	Stine, Aaron
16446273 9/5/2013	Emails with S. Ross (Gibson), J. Morgan and J. Jackson re closing process.	1.20	Hussain, Munib
16437302 9/5/2013	Work on shareholder consents for exit facility (.6); work on resolutions for LTCaycos (1.4); prep of sig pages for resolutions (.2).	3.20	Kurtich, Amy
16479827 9/5/2013	Communications with director candidate for Arcapita Singapore re terms of service (.2); communications with E. Fleck re proposed terms (.4); coordinate gathering of CBB forms re proposed directors of Arcapita Bank (.5); coordinate delivery of plan-related documentation to A&M (.4); revise presentation re Arcapita Singapore (1.8); communications with A. Stine re same (.1); communications with [REDACTED] (0.5).	3.90	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16433866 9/5/2013	Call with A. Stine and A. Everett regarding warrant and asset transfer agreement (0.8); review and revise director engagement letter (0.5).	1.30	Shah, Kim M.
16444701 9/5/2013	Emails internally re closing mechanics.	0.50	Jackson, Jonathon



**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16444691 9/6/2013	Review draft Mudaraba sukuk documents (1.6); attend conference call with Gibson Dunn/MTHM New York to discuss sukuk process/conditions precedent documentation (0.5); review email correspondence (0.1); communications re pending issues with M. Hussain (0.2).	2.40	Dewar, John R.
16463625 9/6/2013	Call to discuss Sukuk closing checklist, status of satisfaction of c.p.'s and proposed closing process (1.0); numerous calls and notes w/GDC and K. Shah and E. Fleck re logistics and mechanics re structuring and process for closing step plan and other exit transactions (2.6); notes in re scope of post-effective date insurance coverage (.6); calls and notes re rescheduling of RA board meeting and logistics for approval of transaction (.7); discuss issues re T&I Agreement w/K. Shah, A. Stine and E. Fleck (.7)	5.60	Morgan, Jane E.
16433851 9/6/2013	Prep for closing call (0.1); t/c with Sukuk teams re: closing mechanics (0.5); review correspondence re: ██████████ (0.2); communications with A. Kurtich re: bylaw comments (0.3); t/c with GDC re: closing mechanics (1.4); review ██████████ (0.3); correspondence with N. Kamphaus re: same (0.2); communications with E. Fleck re: same (0.1); review revised shareholders agreement (0.4); review ██████████ purchase agreement re: same (0.4); correspondence with J. Morgan re: same (0.1); correspondence with GDC re: same (0.1); correspondence with A. Stine re: signatories (0.1); correspondence with FTI re: bank information (0.2).	4.40	Everett II, Andrew H.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16433855 9/6/2013	Call with GDC regarding closing (1.4); internal corporate status communications (0.9); draft and revise resolutions (3.0); review, respond to and draft emails (1.5); continue creating resolutions signature page packet (3.2); revise Articles (0.3); revise Services Agreement and circulate (0.5); revise board letter and circulate (0.4); continue creating documents signature page packet (0.5).	11.70	Stine, Aaron
16446274 9/6/2013	Update Signing checklist and the Sukuk Documents (1.40); emails with Sukuk team re signing process and execution versions of the notices of assignment (0.50); review and update Sukuk Documents to reflect comments from BIL (as Registrar) (1.70); participate in call with Milbank and GDC in relation to closing process (0.50); emails with S. Lau (GDC) re list of Restricted Subsidiaries (0.40); emails with J. Jackson re comments from BIL (0.80); emails and call with Latham in relation to signing procedure (1.20).	6.50	Hussain, Munib
16466287 9/6/2013	Call w GDC and Milbank teams re closing checklist.	0.50	Newman, Peter
16437303 9/6/2013	Prep of complete set of resolutions (.8); revise LT Cayco resolutions with Cayman comments (3.7); prep revised set of resolutions (.9).	5.40	Kurtich, Amy
16479828 9/6/2013	Revise presentation re Arcapita Singapore (2.2); communications with E. Fleck re same (.2); call with GDC and Milbank corporate team re effective date procedures (1.2); follow-up communications with corporate team re same (.7); communications with A. Chatterjee (Gibson Dunn) re form of warrant (.3); communications with A. Stine re same (.2).	4.80	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16433867 9/6/2013	Communications with J. Morgan re plan for signing documents (0.6); communications with A. Stine regarding outstanding issues including transition d&o agreement, resolutions, matters with DAA, issues with topco articles (0.9); review list of documents for board (0.3); email to J. Morgan re open issues (0.2); communications with J. Morgan re: MSA, indemnification issues (2.6).	4.60	Shah, Kim M.
16444702 9/6/2013	Emails with M. Hussain re comments to sukuk.	0.50	Jackson, Jonathon
16443634 9/7/2013	Numerous communications with GDC and K. Shah and E. Fleck re: logistics and mechanics re: structuring and process for closing step plan and other exit transactions (1.8); instruction note to Sukuk and exit teams re: same (1.1); notes in re: scope of post-effective date insurance coverage (.5).	3.40	Morgan, Jane E.
16433852 9/7/2013	Review correspondence re: closing mechanics.	0.40	Everett li, Andrew H.
16433856 9/7/2013	Revise resolutions (1.3); review, respond to and draft emails (0.7); correspondence with K. Shah re same (0.4).	2.40	Stine, Aaron
16446275 9/7/2013	Review and update Sukuk Documents.	1.20	Hussain, Munib
16479829 9/7/2013	Revise presentation re Arcapita Singapore (2.1); communications with Houlihan re same (.3); communications with E. Fleck re same (.2); communications with potential financial advisor for Arcapita Singapore (.2); communications with E. Fleck re same (.2).	2.90	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16433868 9/7/2013	Comm. with A. Stine and call with J. Morgan re status of documents, resolutions and signature pages (1.0); draft email re distribution of sig pages and documents (0.3); review resolutions, add documents to index (3.0); review bank articles regarding number of directors (0.7).	5.00	Shah, Kim M.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16437320 9/8/2013	Participate on call with GDC, Arcapita, Milbank re: indemnity agreement and Bahrain issues (1.5); review follow-up drafts (.7).	2.20	Fleck, Evan R.
16443635 9/8/2013	Review revised draft of T&I from GDC (.6); participate in call re: same (1.5); review and comment on revised draft of T&I from A. Stine (.7); communications re signing logistics with GDC and K. Shah and E. Fleck (1.3); notes re: proposed items for Audit Committee agenda (.7); notes re: [REDACTED] (.4).	5.20	Morgan, Jane E.
16433853 9/8/2013	T/c with GDC re: shareholders meeting and transition agmt (1.5); review correspondence re: closing mechanics (0.3); review [REDACTED] settlement documents (1.4); correspondence with J. Morgan and E. Fleck re: same (0.3); correspondence with J. Ebberson re: articles (0.2).	3.70	Everett li, Andrew H.
16433857 9/8/2013	Call with GDC regarding Transition and Indemnification Agreement (1.5); call with GDC to discuss closing (0.4); revise form of Service Agreement and circulate (0.6); read and respond to emails (1.3); revise Transition and Indemnification Agreement and circulate (0.5); revise resolutions (0.5).	4.80	Stine, Aaron
16437304 9/8/2013	Call re bank board and indemnification agreement with GDC, AIM (1.5); review of resolutions for index (2.0); review of changed pages of indemnification agreement (1.2); review of resolutions from GDC (0.6); call re execution of documents with GDC (0.4); questions about financing sigs amd resolutions (0.5); communications with j. Morgan re open issues (0.4); review [REDACTED] docs (0.3); review emails about logistics of signing documents (0.2); review Mourant comments to resos (0.5).	7.60	Shah, Kim M.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16449515 9/9/2013	Review email correspondence regarding the sukuk documentation and pending issues (0.5); communications with M. Hussain (0.3), review draft documentation (0.6); review pre-execution versions of sukuk documents (1.3); review organisational documents of RA Invest (0.2).	2.90	Dewar, John R.
16463626 9/9/2013	Prep for and participate in call w/UCC Chair and co-advisors (1.9); call w/ M. Rosenthal (GDC) re CBB process (1.0); review revised draft of T&I from GDC (.6); calls and notes re issues and proposed resolution (.8); numerous calls and notes re audit committee charter and process (1.5); call and notes re draft term sheet for HQ shareholders agreement (.7); discuss schedule and logistics for consummating POR and closing logistics including signing of pages and coordination of exit financing (1.2); communications re Houston SHA w/A. Everett and J. Ebberson (.7); review same (.4); calls and notes re ratification of Eurolog guarantee (1.1).	9.90	Morgan, Jane E.
16437298 9/9/2013	Follow up re: closing items (0.9); o/c with team re: closing items (0.8); correspondence with J. Morgan re: shareholders agreements (0.4); o/c with J. Ebberson re: same (1.0); revise shareholders agreement (1.6); review ██████████ (.8); t/c with GDC re: same (0.2); correspondence with E. Fleck re: same (0.1); t/c with HL re: AHQ term sheet (0.2); t/c with FTI re: asset transfer agreement (0.3); correspondence with A. Kurtich re: same (0.2); review revised asset transfer agreement (0.1); review WCF amendments (0.3); correspondence with J. Ebberson re: same (0.2); review Latham comments to shareholders agreement (0.6); t/c's with Latham re: same (0.4); correspondence with J. Morgan re: same (0.1); review correspondence re: leases (0.1); correspondence with J. Fish re: closing items (0.2); correspondence with K. Shah re: closing items (0.2).	8.70	Everett li, Andrew H.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16447654 9/9/2013	Comm. re board meeting agenda and schedule with E. Fleck, K. Shah, Soundpath (.5); draft email to board re ED milestone and other matters (.4); comm. E. Fleck re same (.2); revise and circulate same (.2); prepare agenda for next week's board call (.2); emails E. Fleck, J. Morgan, K. Shah re same (.2); calendar board call on 9-16 (.2); prepare audit committee agenda (.1); email call materials to RA audit committee (.2); emails E. Fleck re same (.2).	2.40	Ulvad, Greta R.
16447657 9/9/2013	Review revised Transition and Indemnification Agreement and circulate (0.3); revise resolutions (2.5); create finance resolutions redline packet (0.8); revise AST transfer agreement and circulate (0.4); correspondence with N. Kamphaus re same (0.4); correspondence with A. Kurtich re open issues (0.5); correspondence with J. Morgan and K. Shah re open issues (0.5); call with GDC regarding closing logistics (0.5); revise transaction documents (1.8); internal status meeting (0.8); read, draft and respond to emails re open issues (1.7).	10.20	Stine, Aaron
16446276 9/9/2013	Telecon with BIL re Account Pledge Agreement (0.80); telecon with [REDACTED] (0.30); update [REDACTED] (1.60); emails with E. Khalil (Gibson) re Fatwa (0.80); emails with J. Fish re execution formalities for English law documents (1.20); finalise Sukuk Documents (2.00); prepare signature packs of Sukuk Documents (2.50); prepare email in relation to 'pre-execution' versions of the Sukuk Documents to the Sukuk Team (1.00); emails with Mourants in relation to director's certificates and issuance of the legal opinion (0.90).	11.10	Hussain, Munib
16466288 9/9/2013	Work on closing issues re sukuk issuance (.7); comm. re same w N Kamphaus (.4).	1.10	Newman, Peter

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16443632 9/9/2013	Communications w/ A. Stine re: director engagement letters (.1); review and organize e-mail (.6); prepare engagement letters for each RA director (.9); review J Jill TH Articles (.7); correspondence w/ A. Everett re: same (.4); meeting w/ Milbank corporate team re: effective date planning (.8); review SHA from GDC and update tracking chart (2.8); review WCF agreements and amendments and prepare chart with schedule references for each agreement to be included in SHA (3.9); review timeline from K. Shah (.1); meet w/ A. Everett re: SHA comments and finalizing process (1.0).	11.30	Ebberson, James K.
16452984 9/9/2013	Communications with A. Stine re meeting thurs (.1); prepare completed director engagement letters (.6); meet with Milbank team re status (.8); review and revise resolutions (1.7); review and prep of original Sukuk financing doc sig pages (.5); revisions with comments to Exit Facility resolutions and review of signatories (3.3); work on retained assets section of ATA with AIM (1.1).	8.10	Kurtich, Amy
16479830 9/9/2013	Review and revise various corporate documents and presentations in preparation for effective date, including [REDACTED] and disbursing agent agreement; communications with R. Keller (Hogan Lovells) re disbursing agent issues.	8.10	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16449086 9/9/2013	Communications with J. Morgan re status update on resolutions and DAA and agenda for meeting (0.3); communications with A. Stine regarding status update on all documents (0.6); communications with G. Ulvad regarding agenda (0.2); communications with A. Stine and N. Kamphaus regarding DAA (0.3); draft list of to-dos for meeting at 12 (0.1); call with J. Fish regarding procedures for the upcoming week (0.2); corporate group meeting (0.8); corr. re custodian agreement with A. Stine (0.2); communications with A. Stine and J. Morgan re T&I (0.3); CBB call with GDC (0.8); communications with E. Fleck and J. Morgan regarding insurance (0.2); call with J. Fish regarding signature pages (0.6); draft timeline (1.1); clean up DAA (0.6); review distribution deck prepared by FRG (0.4); communications with J. Morgan re status (0.5); additional changes to DAA (0.7).	7.90	Shah, Kim M.
16483725 9/10/2013	Tasks related to 40 Act and Securities Act analysis in particular in relation to transfer ability of securities, including calls with NY and London Milbank teams.	3.70	Schwartz, Peter J.
16449516 9/10/2013	Review email correspondence (0.2); review draft sukuk documentation (0.6); communications with M. Hussain regarding pending issues (0.2); internal communications re same (0.8).	1.80	Dewar, John R.
16446024 9/10/2013	Attend call with audit committee of new board to prepare for responsibilities and post-effective date work (.7); comm. with M. Doheny (RA board) and E. Fleck thereafter (.3).	1.00	Dunne, Dennis F.
16459111 9/10/2013	Communications re distribution mechanics.	2.10	Janson, Thomas C.



**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16446015 9/10/2013	Numerous calls and notes re: process for coordinating the closing of step plan, POR and GS exit (1.1); calls and notes re: Sukuk transfer and closing mechanics (1.2); review and comment on Asset Transfer Agreement (.7); meet w/ A. Everett, K. Shah and J. Ebberson re: █████ share transfer (.3); communications issues in SHA's with A. Everett and J. Ebberson (.7); call with Latham to discuss comments on SHA (.5); communications re issues re: resolutions with K. Shah, A. Stine and S. Bulfone (GDC) (1.1); and comment on HL UCC update (.6).	6.20	Morgan, Jane E.
16477270 9/10/2013	Discussion on board arrangements.	1.30	Stamp, Mark
16443627 9/10/2013	Revise asset transfer agreement (1.4); correspondence with J. Morgan re: same (0.2); review GDC comments to same (0.4); correspondence with FTI re: same (0.1); revise shareholders agreements (2.4); correspondence with J. Ebberson re: same (0.4); prep for call with Latham re: shareholders agreement (0.2); t/c with Latham re: same (0.5); correspondence with J. Morgan re: same (0.6); correspondence with J. Fish re: employee issues (0.2); t/c with B. Rustum (GDC) re: guaranty language (0.2); t/c with C. Babcock (GDC) re: director appointments (0.1); correspondence with Bahraini counsel re: leases (0.1); meet with J. Morgan, K. Shah, A. Everett re █████ (0.3); correspondence with working group re: open items for closing (0.3); correspondence with J. Morgan and K. Shah re: same (0.2).	7.60	Everett li, Andrew H.
16447655 9/10/2013	Coordinate re audit committee call (.3); schedule same (.1).	0.40	Ulvad, Greta R.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16447658 9/10/2013	Read, draft and respond to emails re open corporate matters (2.5); draft and revise resolutions (3.2); internal corporate correspondence (0.8); internal correspondence following UCC call (0.3); status update communications with J. Morgan and K. Shah (0.7); participate in signature call with B. de Jong (future RA Board) (1.1); correspondence with A. Kurtich (0.4); calls with GDC regarding closing (1.0); revise transaction documents (0.4).	10.40	Stine, Aaron
16446277 9/10/2013	Communications re distributions with N. Kamphaus (1.10); continue to update Sukuk Documents to reflect comments from Hogan Lovells (1.90); communications with E. Fleck and P. Schwartz in relation to Investment Company Act issue (1.50); review Director's (Mudareb) certificate (0.80); emails with N. Kamphaus re issuance of Global Certificate (1.50); emails with Latham in relation to Delegates query (0.90); attend to signing process (2.00); send signature packs for Sukuk Documents to BIL, RA Invest and the Delegate (1.60).	11.30	Hussain, Munib
16459074 9/10/2013	Review closing deliverables (1.5); prepare signature page packets (.7); correspondence re: execution of documents (1.3); coordinate closing deliverables with K. Shah, A. Stine, A. Everett (1.5).	5.50	Fish, Julia E.
16466289 9/10/2013	Distribution issues call w BIL and WTC (.7); comm. re issues arising from same w N Kamphaus (.4); review closing checklist (.5); consider note issuance issue (1.5); comm. w corporate, securities teams and M. Hussain (1.3); follow up re same (.5).	4.90	Newman, Peter

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16443633 9/10/2013	Revise SHA for [REDACTED] (2.3); revise chart for tracking WCF agreements (.7); meet w/ A. Everett, K. Shah and J. Morgan re: [REDACTED] (.3); communications w/ A. Stine and K. Medrano (GDC) re: [REDACTED] (.2); call w/ Latham re: comments to SHA (.5); prep for same (.2); revise SHA for [REDACTED] (2.5); revise SHA for [REDACTED] (.7); correspondence w/ A. Stine re: resolution packet (.2); prepare packet of resolutions reflecting revisions since August 20 (.5); review and organize e-mails (.6).	8.70	Ebberson, James K.
16452985 9/10/2013	Prep of Sukuk documents for signing (.3); revisions of resolutions amending articles (1.7); review and confirmation of shareholders for resolutions amending articles (.7); creation and review of signature page packet for all resolutions (2.1).	4.80	Kurtich, Amy
16479831 9/10/2013	Call with all service providers and FTI regarding distribution procedures; follow-up communications re same; communications with corporate team regarding outstanding documentation needed for effective date; revise agreements in connection with same; communications with corporate and finance teams regarding logistics of issuing sukuk obligations.	7.60	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16449087 9/10/2013	Review of custodian agreement (0.5); call regarding disbursing procedures (0.8); call with J. O'Grady (GD) regarding documents to send to board (0.3); review list to send to GDC for board deliverables (0.4); meet with A. Everett, J. Ebberson and J. Morgan regarding SHA issues and █████ (0.3); circulate agent agreements (0.5); review custodian agreement (0.7); revise timeline (0.2); communications with J. Morgan re Sukuk issues (0.2); revise timeline (0.3); communications with J. Fish and A. Stine re signatures (0.3); call with J. O'Grady (GDC) regarding edits to list (0.5); call to J. Truitt (Hogan) re DAA (0.1); comm. with J. Morgan and London team re Sukuk (1.6); communications with J. Morgan re Sukuk (0.9); communications with J. Truitt, N. Kamphaus and M. Hussain re Sukuk (1.0); communications with E. Fleck re updates from the day (0.6); address questions/issues re resolutions (1.8).	9.70	Shah, Kim M.
16483729 9/10/2013	Comm. w/ N. Kamphaus re financials, email re financial requirements.	1.00	Jackson, Jonathon
16483726 9/11/2013	Tasks related to 40 Act and Securities Act analysis in particular in relation to transfer ability of securities, including calls with NY and London Milbank teams.	2.10	Schwartz, Peter J.
16449517 9/11/2013	Review email correspondence regarding pending sukuk documentation issues (0.6); attend conference call with Wilmington Trust to address issuance of certificated/global notes (0.7); telecon with BIL to discuss definitive note issue and funds for mechanics (0.5); coordinate sukuk document drafting work (0.2); communications with M. Hussain regarding pending issues (0.2).	2.20	Dewar, John R.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16459112 9/11/2013	Attend call re Disbursing Agent (.7); call re Sukuk (.5); review changes to documents (.8); call re: handling of undistributed shares (.5); calls and emails re: same (.4); research re: alternative trading methods and platforms for shares (.6).	3.50	Janson, Thomas C.
16449082 9/11/2013	Participate in conference call to discuss new proposal re Disbursing Agent (.7); numerous calls and notes re issues raised by BIL re allocation of amounts under global certificates (2.4); review and revise multiple drafts of board agenda and discuss scope of resolutions for board (1.8); internal corporate team meeting re status (.5); review logistics of obtaining signature pages and closing mechanics (.5); review revised agreement with AST (.3); review issues re Latham comments on SHA's (.7); respond to queries re scope of audit committee charter (.6); review issues re T&I draft (.6).	8.10	Morgan, Jane E.
16446010 9/11/2013	Revise committee presentation re: case developments (2.5); correspondence with J. Morgan re: same (0.4); correspondence with N. Kamphaus re: HQ term sheet (0.2); review revised shareholders agreements (2.7); communications with J. Ebberson re: same (1.2); revise asset transfer agreement (1.5); correspondence with FTI re: same (0.3); correspondence with J. Morgan re: same (0.3); working group meeting re: open points (0.5); correspondence with Latham re: shareholders comments (0.3); correspondence with GDC re: same (0.2); correspondence with J. Morgan re: same (0.3); correspondence with A. Stine re: signature packets (0.3); correspondence with J. Fish re: shareholders agmt provision (0.1); t/c with B. Rustum (GDC) re: shareholder agreement comments (0.2).	10.80	Everett li, Andrew H.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16447656 9/11/2013	Comm. E. Fleck re open board issues and scheduling (.2); coordinate re next week's board calls (.2); prepare email to audit comm. re [REDACTED] (.2); comm. N. Kamphaus and J. Jackson re same (.1); comm. N. Kamphaus and W. Ng (FTI) re same (.1); comm. E. Fleck re same (.1); revise and circulate same (.2).	1.10	Ulvad, Greta R.
16447659 9/11/2013	Read, draft and respond to emails re open issues (2.5); draft and revise resolutions (2.0); internal corporate status meeting (0.5); revise transaction documents (1.9); correspondence with A. Kurtich (0.6).	7.60	Stine, Aaron
16446278 9/11/2013	Participate in call re [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (0.70); participate in call re [REDACTED] (0.50); attend to structuring issues relating to issuance of Definitive Registered Certificates (1.10); attend to emails with J. Morgan and P. Newman re issuance of Definitive Registered Certificates (1.30); continue to update Sukuk Documents to reflect Definitive Registered Certificates issuance (4.90); review Issuer resolutions (0.60); emails with N. Kamphaus and E. Fleck re audit committee (0.90); emails with Latham in relation to Delegates query (0.90); emails with E. Fleck in relation to same (0.70); attend to signing process (1.10); emails re KYC compliance with BIL (0.50).	13.20	Hussain, Munib
16452979 9/11/2013	Review SHA for [REDACTED] (.3); update tracking chart for SHA (.2); review SHA for [REDACTED] (.3); correspondence w/ J. Morgan and A. Everett re: SHA (.7); diligence re: ATA (.4); meeting w/ Milbank corporate team re: board packet (.5); review all SHA for major investments, including revisions from GDC and investment-specific information (5.1); review and organize e-mail (.7).	8.20	Ebberson, James K.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16452986 9/11/2013	Revisions to Cayman resolutions (2.4); Milbank corporate team meeting (.5); preparation of signature pages for signing (1.8); preparation of resolutions and blacklines for board package (4.2).	8.90	Kurtich, Amy
16479832 9/11/2013	Call with Wilmington and Milbank team re distribution issues; communications with corporate team re same; follow-up calls and emails re distribution issues; review issues re Singapore entity; communications with E. Fleck re same; review professional fees escrow agreement issues; revise disbursing agent agreement and transfer agent agreement.	6.10	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16449088 9/11/2013	Review DAA (0.3); call re DAA with Hogan and Wilmington (0.7); communications with A. Everett, J. Ebberson and A. Stine re status of docs and update to priority of tasks (0.7); call with BIL (0.5); Milbank corporate status meeting (0.5); communications with N. Kamphaus re steps for certificated Sukuk note (0.5); revise DAA (0.8); communications with J. Morgan re update on Sukuk and leases (0.9); communications with A. Stine re resolutions (0.1); call with W. Ng at FTI re custodian agreement (0.3); questions on DAA (0.2); questions re Sukuk (0.4); communications with J. Morgan re Sukuk (0.3); email to N. Kamphaus re AST and shares and warrants nominee (0.1); call with S. Ross (GDC) re dates and sig pages (0.2); call with GDC re CBB issues (0.2); call with R. Keller (Hogan) (0.8); revisions to AST agreement (0.5); comm. with T. Janson and J. Morgan re 1145 (0.5); questions/revisions to DAA (0.6); communications with J. Morgan and E. Fleck regarding status (0.5); revise AST agreement (0.4); review Professional services escrow agreement (0.4); organize docs to send to board (1.0); internal communications re re board distribution (0.8); emails re sukuk (0.3); revise DAA and AST (1.9).	14.40	Shah, Kim M.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16483718 9/11/2013	Draft distribution agreement and comm. with M. Hussain re same.	3.50	Jackson, Jonathon
16483719 9/11/2013	Conf call w/ listing agents (.7) and emails re certificates (.8).	1.50	Jackson, Jonathon
16447031 9/11/2013	Review Global Certificate.	3.50	Jomier, Theophile
16483727 9/12/2013	Tasks related to 40 Act and Securities Act analysis in particular in relation to transfer ability of securities, including calls with NY and London Milbank teams.	0.70	Schwartz, Peter J.
16452978 9/12/2013	Advice re IA issues.	0.70	Aaron, Wayne M.
16449518 9/12/2013	Review revised draft sukuk documents (0.8); communications re pending issues with M. Hussain (0.3); review email correspondence and consider issues raised by counsel to Exit Lenders (0.8); follow up re closing checklist (0.4).	2.30	Dewar, John R.
16459113 9/12/2013	Communications re open issues on docs.	1.20	Janson, Thomas C.
16449083 9/12/2013	Review and revise multiple drafts of board agenda and transmission email (1.3); discuss Monday closing logistics with internal corporate team (.5); review and discuss issues related to issuance of Sukuk note and disbursing agent agreement (1.2); review scope of services and respond to queries from FTI re accounting support (.6); calls and notes re BIL KYC process and workaround in the event they fail to complete internal process (.5); review logistics of obtaining signature pages and closing mechanics (1.0).	5.10	Morgan, Jane E.
16459124 9/12/2013	Discussion with B. Thomas (GDC) regarding Arcapita notice in US.	0.20	Heyl, Dorothy



**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16447653 9/12/2013	Review revised shareholders agreement (1.5); correspondence with J. Ebberson re: same (0.4); prepare board materials (3.1); correspondence with J. Morgan re: same (0.3); t/c with GDC re: asset transfer agreement (0.5); revise same (0.5); correspondence with M. Hussain re: closing deliverables (0.3); review signatures necessary for closing (2.2); correspondence with J. Fish re: certificates (0.2).	9.00	Everett li, Andrew H.
16452972 9/12/2013	Coordinate re board calls and schedules (.2); comm. with E. Fleck and corporate team re Monday's board call agenda (.1); send same to G. Davis (RA) (.1); prepare, revise and circulate emails to board with call materials and communications with E. Fleck and corporate team re same (1.1); email internal group re same (.1).	1.60	Ulvad, Greta R.
16449078 9/12/2013	Read, draft and respond to emails (2.5); oversee signing of documents with G. Davis (RA Chair) (4.5); internal corporate correspondence (0.8); revise transaction documents and circulate (0.7); correspondence with A. Kurtich (0.4); calls with GDC regarding closing (0.8).	9.70	Stine, Aaron
16453731 9/12/2013	Emails with J. Morgan and BIL re opening of account (1.00); emails to M. James (Lovells) and Wilmington in relation custodian role and enforcement action response from Latham (1.80); update Sukuk Documents summary and attend to related emails with B. Jordan (Houlihan) (0.90); emails with Mourants in relation to Issuer's resolutions (0.80); email to N. Kamphaus re audit committee requirements (0.50); review and update Sukuk Documents (2.50); emails with [REDACTED] (0.30); emails with K. Shah in relation to Disbursing Agreement (0.90); review Disbursing Agreement and consider interface with the Sukuk Documents (2.00).	10.70	Hussain, Munib
16469535 9/12/2013	Signature page siging with E. Davis.	3.00	Fish, Julia E.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16466290 9/12/2013	Work on finalizing sukuk disbursement structure (2.5); review disbursement agency agreement revisions (.5); correspond w team re same (.4); call w Hogan Lovells re same (.5).	3.90	Newman, Peter
16459091 9/12/2013	Prepare for and attend meeting at Gibson-Dunn's office to work on closing sets.	2.70	Begley, Kevin
16452980 9/12/2013	Meeting w/ Milbank corporate team (.5); revise all Major and Eurolog SHA and send comments to GDC re: same (5.7); prepare SHA and org documents for distribution to RA board (1.7); review and revise Meridian SHA (.5); review and organize e-mail (.5).	8.90	Ebberson, James K.
16452987 9/12/2013	Milbank internal meeting re next steps (.5); prep of documents for signing (1.6); set up and administer signing of documents (4.5); preparation of executed signature pages and exhibits with resolutions (5.3).	11.90	Kurtich, Amy
16479833 9/12/2013	Review and revise various agreements related to closing; communications with corporate team re same; revise verification materials in connection with distributions; follow-up communications with FTI, Wilmington, Gibson Dunn, and GCG re same.	5.70	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16449089 9/12/2013	Prepare for UCC call (0.3); milbank corporate meeting (0.5); call about the time for stamping documents to GDC (0.1); call with AST re agreement (0.2); call to R. Keller at Hogan re DAA (0.1); comm. with K. Begley re stamping documents (0.3); comm. with J. Fish re LLC certificate (0.2); revise DAA (0.8); comm. with J. Morgan re next steps on DAA (0.3); comm. with A. Everett and J. Morgan re signature pages and protocol for Monday (0.3); comm. with J. Morgan re issues with exit documents (0.3); comm. with J. Morgan and A. Everett re Monday procedures (0.9); revise DAA (0.6); additional questions/issues re DAA and revisions (1.4); discuss closing issues (0.5); work on board distribution (0.8).	7.60	Shah, Kim M.
16483720 9/12/2013	Review docs from M. Hussain.	3.50	Jackson, Jonathon
16483721 9/12/2013	Comm. w/ M. Hussain re revised docs, and call re financial requirements.	1.50	Jackson, Jonathon
16447032 9/12/2013	Review Mudara Agreement, Deposit Account Pledge Agreement, Agency and Administration Agreement.	7.00	Jomier, Theophile
16483728 9/13/2013	Tasks related to 40 Act and Securities Act analysis in particular in relation to transfer ability of securities, including calls with NY and London Milbank teams.	1.10	Schwartz, Peter J.
16449523 9/13/2013	Review email correspondence relating to the Mudaraba sukuk (.4); communications re pending sukuk issues with M. Hussain (.4); attend conference call with GDC/Milbank New York to discuss sukuk and exit pending signing/closing (0.8); review latest drafts of the Islamic documentation (0.8).	2.40	Dewar, John R.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16449084 9/13/2013	Review and discuss proposed revisions from Hogan re Disbursing Agent Agreement (.8); discuss issues re AIML account management letter and numerous notes re same (.6); notes re continuation of coverage of insurance (.3); issues re release of signature pages and closing mechanics (2.5); notes to review and discuss issues re London sublease and RA guarantee (.8); work on proposed agenda for Wednesday RA board call and ratification of Eurolog guaranty (.8); issues re regulatory notice provisions (.4); discuss issues re Latham request for proxy in SHA's and notes and calls re same (1.0).	7.20	Morgan, Jane E.
16449075 9/13/2013	T/c with GDC and Milbank teams re: closing items (0.8); finalize shareholders agreements (1.4); prepare resolutions for misc. corporate items (1.3); draft side letter re: bank account administration (1.0); correspondence with J. Morgan re: same (0.4); t/c with GDC re: [REDACTED] (0.5); analyze same (1.0); correspondence with J. Morgan and J. Ebberson re: same (0.4); draft provisions re: same (0.6); o/c with Milbank team re: closing items (0.5); correspondence with HL re: [REDACTED] (0.1).	8.00	Everett li, Andrew H.
16452973 9/13/2013	Comm. chairman and team re call agenda and matters (.2); prepare agenda for audit committee call (.1); emails E. Fleck and FAs re same (.2); circulate same to audit committee chairman (.1); review AGM materials (.2); emails with FAs and E. Fleck re board and audit committee call materials (.3); prepare agenda for Wednesday's board call (.1); call K. Shah re board materials (.2); prepare additional materials email for Monday's board call (.2); comm. E. Fleck and corporate team re same and open issues (.5); circulate same (.1); comm. internal team re open issues (.4).	2.60	Ulvad, Greta R.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16449079 9/13/2013	Read, draft and respond to emails re open issues (3.0); internal corporate correspondence (1.0); revise and organize transaction documents and circulate (3.0); correspondence with A. Kurtich (0.5); calls with GDC regarding closing (0.5).	8.00	Stine, Aaron
16453732 9/13/2013	Attend to structuring aspects of Definitive Registered Certificates and reflecting the same in the Sukuk Documents (4.20); communications with J. Jackson in relation to the issuance of a Definitive Registered Certificate (0.70); prepare execution versions of the Sukuk Documents (2.50); emails sending updated versions of the Sukuk Documents to BIL, Wilmington and RA Invest (1.90); participate in call with Milbank and GDC re closing process (0.80); communications with J. Morgan in relation to Disbursing Agreement issues (0.40); review Disbursing Agreement (0.60); emails with BIL and S. Ross (Gibson Dunn) in relation to account opening (0.90); communications with G. Dunnett re collation of Sukuk Documents (0.70).	12.70	Hussain, Munib
16477273 9/13/2013	Comm. w J Morgan, M Hussain and others re sukuk closing issues (.6); emails re same (.5).	1.10	Newman, Peter
16452981 9/13/2013	Call w/ B. Rustum (GDC) re: notice parties (.1); research and e-mail to A. Everett re: same (.5); call w/ GDC re: closing process (.8); review and send comments to all Minor SHA (6.7); correspondence w/ A. Everett and J. Morgan re: [REDACTED] (.5); review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (.2); review and send comments to SHA for Lusail (.5); meet w/ corporate team re: [REDACTED] (.5); review schedules (.2); review and organize e-mail (.7).	10.70	Ebberson, James K.
16452988 9/13/2013	Draft of resolutions for RA Holding Corp (.9); review of data room documents (1.8).	2.70	Kurtich, Amy

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16479834 9/13/2013	Communications with corporate team re logistical issues for closing on effective date; review and revise various agreements re same; communications with D. Mollo-Christensen re [REDACTED].	1.20	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16449090 9/13/2013	Review of documents to finalize (0.5); call with GDC re logistics (0.8); internal Milbank update communications (0.3); review and revise signature pages and resolutions from suite of resolutions re the financing (1.4); communications with E. Fleck and J. Morgan re logistics for next week (0.4); review of documents and signature pages (0.6); email to AST re signature pages (0.3); communications with Milbank team re Sukuk procedures (0.4); revise DAA (0.4); email re signature page logistics (0.3); meet with Milbank team re logistics of final documents (0.5); review and revise DAA (0.9); call with J. O'Grady (GDC) (0.2); circulate Sukuk documents for Board package (0.4); call with G. Ulvad regarding next steps (0.2); correspondence with team regarding questions (0.8); call with GDC re signature pages (0.2); communications with team re open issues (0.7); revisions to DAA (0.5); questions issues re Sukuk and other documents signature pages (1.0).	10.80	Shah, Kim M.
16483722 9/13/2013	Calls re holder certifications, calls re financials and audit requirements/procedures.	2.00	Jackson, Jonathon
16455015 9/13/2013	Assist with closing documents.	1.50	Thaqi, Egzon
16449807 9/13/2013	Review of Declaration of Trust and Charge and Assignment Deed.	4.50	Jomier, Theophile
16463889 9/14/2013	Review email correspondence relating to the Mudaraba sukuk documentation.	0.20	Dewar, John R.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16449085 9/14/2013	Numerous notes re replacement of Singapore director (.4); review and discuss proposed revisions from Hogan re Disbursing Agent Agreement (.8); review and revise AIML account management letter and numerous notes re same (1.0); notes re continuation of coverage of insurance (.3); issues re release of signature pages and closing mechanics (2.3).	4.80	Morgan, Jane E.
16449076 9/14/2013	Review correspondence re: closing documents (0.6); revise side letter (1.0); correspondence re: [REDACTED] (0.2); correspondence re: Singapore director issues (0.3).	2.10	Everett li, Andrew H.
16452974 9/14/2013	Emails with E. Fleck and corporate team re open issues (.3); prepare response to UCC member re listing (.4); comm. E. Fleck and N. Kamphaus re same (.1).	0.80	Ulvad, Greta R.
16449080 9/14/2013	Review transaction documents and signature pages in Sharepoint data site (2.6); meeting with K. Shah re sig procedure (0.9); internal communications re closing (2.6).	6.10	Stine, Aaron
16453733 9/14/2013	Coordinate re signature pages to various Sukuk Documents (2.20); draft and send execution emails to BIL, RA Invest, RA Mudareb and the Delegate (2.80); emails with A. Stine re execution of deeds (0.80); comment on updated certificate for Mudareb (0.80); finalise Fee Letter (0.30); review emails re signing process (0.50).	7.40	Hussain, Munib
16452982 9/14/2013	Review and organize e-mail (.5); review signature pages provided by GDC (5.9); draft and send e-mail to GDC re: open items relating to signature pages (.5).	6.90	Ebberson, James K.
16452989 9/14/2013	Review of executed signature pages.	7.20	Kurtich, Amy

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16479835 9/14/2013	Communications with prospective Singapore director re compensation (.9); communications with E. Fleck re same (.6).	1.50	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16452993 9/14/2013	Meet with A. Stine regarding signature page process (0.9); communications with J. Morgan re Sukuk signing and lease signing (0.3); communications with team re checklist and datasite and search for regulatory docs (0.6); call with J. O'Grady (GDC) re sig pages and other issues (0.5); review side letter re AIML (0.6); call with J. O'Grady (GDC) re [REDACTED] (0.1); revise DAA (0.7); compile AST agreement, prepare sig pages for DAA (1.0); emails with Hogan re DAA (0.4); emails regarding [REDACTED] (0.5); respond to emails regarding all effective date matters (2.0).	7.60	Shah, Kim M.
16463890 9/15/2013	Review email correspondence regarding Exit Facility related issues and the Mudaraba sukuk documentation.	0.20	Dewar, John R.
16452992 9/15/2013	Numerous calls and notes re closing issues including AIML bank account authorization side letter, Singapore director replacement, disbursing agent agreement and logistics/mechanics for release of signature pages and closing.	5.50	Morgan, Jane E.
16452969 9/15/2013	Review final closing items (4.6); correspondence with J. Ebberson re: same (0.7); t/c with J. O'Grady (GDC), J. Ebberson, A. Stine re: closing (0.9); correspondence with J. Morgan re: open items (0.3); correspondence re: closing mechanics (0.3); review [REDACTED] (0.2).	7.00	Everett li, Andrew H.



**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16452975 9/15/2013	Revise Wednesday's board call agenda (.1); email Chair re same (.1); review emails to UCC member (.1); emails internally and with FAs re board materials and this week's calls (.3); attend advisor call re prep for board meetings (.4); prepare email to audit committee with materials (.1); comm. E. Fleck re same (.1); revise and circulate same (.1).	1.30	Ulvad, Greta R.
16449081 9/15/2013	Read, draft and respond to emails re closing items (4.0); participate in call with G. Davis (RA Chair) re same (0.3); communications with K. Shah and J. Morgan re same (0.4); communications with J. Harris re same (0.3); continue review of transaction documents and sig pages (3.0); organize and circulate sig pages (0.5); call with A. Everett, J. Ebberson and J. O'Grady at GDC regarding closing items (0.9).	9.40	Stine, Aaron
16453734 9/15/2013	Review emails re signing process (0.50); respond to email from C. Wall (Latham) re Sukuk Documents (0.30); attend to emails with Paget Brown in relation to signing process (0.50); emails with A. Stine, Mourants and S. Ross (Gibson) in relation to Mudareb's certificate and provision of the Register of Directors (1.50); update Signing and CP Checklist (0.70); provide update on CP process to Gibson Dunn (0.50); collate signature pages to the Definitive Certificate (0.40); email to BIL in relation to signing process (1.10).	5.50	Hussain, Munib

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16452983 9/15/2013	Diligence and correspondence w/ Milbank team re: Singapore secretary (.5); review and organize e-mails relating to closing items (2.1); communications w/ A. Everett re: [REDACTED] share transfer (.2); diligence re: [REDACTED] share transfer amounts (.8); update list of open items relating to signatures pages and send same to GDC (.9); correspondence w/ GDC corporate associates re: signature pages (.4); communications w/ A. Stine and A. Everett re: resolutions and potential issues to closing (.2); call w/ J. O'Grady (GDC), A. Everett and A. Stine re: closing process and potential issues (.9); communications w/ K. Shah and J. Morgan re: same (.2); prepare signature packet for review (.7); review signature pages for H. Thompson (Arcapita) (.2); coordinate conference room for closing calls (.2).	7.30	Ebberson, James K.
16452990 9/15/2013	Review of additional and final signature pages (2.6); email corresp re closing items (.4).	3.00	Kurtich, Amy
16479836 9/15/2013	Communications with J. Graves (Gibson Dunn) re disbursing agent agreement (.4); communications with E. Fleck re same (.2); communications with K. Shah re same (.2); communications with prospective director re compensation issues (1.1); communications with E. Fleck re same (.5).	2.40	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16452994 9/15/2013	Prepare DAA signature pages (0.7); advisor call (0.5); communications with A. Stine and E. Fleck re signature pages (0.3); coordinate with team regarding logistics (1.0); issues regarding resolutions (0.8); respond to emails regarding signature pages, Singapore entity and AST (0.5); call with J. Truitt from Hogan re DAA (0.3); revise DAA (0.1); discuss, negotiate and email issues regarding going effective (2.1).	6.30	Shah, Kim M.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16463891 9/16/2013	Review email correspondence relating to the Mudaraba sukuk (0.4); review execution form documentation (0.2).	0.60	Dewar, John R.
16463892 9/16/2013	Review materials circulated by G. Ulvad for Board call meeting.	0.30	Dewar, John R.
16459062 9/16/2013	Review audit committee issues (1.4); attend board meeting (.3); attend audit committee call (.7); comms. with E. Fleck thereafter (.3).	2.70	Dunne, Dennis F.
16468813 9/16/2013	Numerous calls and notes re satisfaction of closing conditions (4.6); participate in board meeting with new RA board to authorize proposed transaction (.3); miscellaneous post-closing calls and notes (1.4).	6.30	Morgan, Jane E.
16452970 9/16/2013	Review various effective date documents (4.0); revise side letter agreements (2.0); multiple t/c's with GDC (1.0); correspondence with M. Altay re: statutory declaration (0.4); draft summary re: same (0.6); communications with team re: effective date items (1.2).	9.20	Everett li, Andrew H.
16465787 9/16/2013	Prepare for/coordinate re today's board and audit committee calls (.7); attend audit committee call (.7); prepare materials emails for Wednesday's board call (.5); comm. internally re same (1.2); email team re new matter numbers (.3); prepare email to audit committee re proposed call (.2); schedule same (.1); prepare materials for weds board call (.3); emails E. Fleck and HL re board distributions (.6).	4.60	Ulvad, Greta R.
16479823 9/16/2013	Participate in call with GDC (0.4); review and respond to emails (0.9); revise resolution and circulate (0.2);	1.50	Stine, Aaron

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16453735 9/16/2013	Participate in pre-closing call with Gibson Dunn (0.60); participate in RA Board Call (0.30); participate in closing call with Gibson Dunn (0.50); prepare signature pages to the Sukuk Documents (1.10); communications with P. Bengier in relation to original signature pages (0.60); emails with BIL re signature pages and finalisation of the Definitive Certificate (0.50); communications with P. Newman re signing process (0.40); prepare zip files of Sukuk documents and draft email to send the same to all parties (0.80); emails with J. Morgan in relation to release of the Sukuk Documents (0.60); emails with E. Fleck re press release (0.30); emails with Mourants and S. Ross (Gibson) in relation to release of legal opinion (0.70).	6.40	Hussain, Munib
16469543 9/16/2013	Closing call (.6) and board meeting call (.3).	0.90	Fish, Julia E.
16469545 9/16/2013	Prepare for (.2) and attend (.3) board call.	0.50	Harris, Jennifer P.
16461753 9/16/2013	Review signature pages (.2); on-going meetings, closing calls and board calls in connection with the Effective Date (7.5); communications w/ K. Shah, A. Everett and A. Kurtich for post-Effective Date action items (.4).	8.10	Ebberson, James K.
16452991 9/16/2013	Closing calls and last minute closing items.	7.90	Kurtich, Amy
16479837 9/16/2013	Call with creditor re distribution question.	0.10	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16465795 9/16/2013	Call with GDC (0.5); call with board to approve (0.3); multiple calls with GDC re mechanics, review of side letters, issues with signature pages, work on putting together new resolutions, putting together execution versions of documents (5.2); communications with A. Everett regarding the London certification and draft email re the same (0.6), respond to emails re closing set (0.2); communications with J. Morgan regarding Latham requests re the exit (1.0), review additional questions re corp documents re financing (2.0).	9.80	Shah, Kim M.
16483723 9/16/2013	Emails re finalizing docs.	0.80	Jackson, Jonathon
16468814 9/17/2013	Numerous calls and notes with K. Shah and E. Fleck re satisfaction of closing conditions for exit facility (2.0); miscellaneous post-closing calls and notes (1.0).	3.00	Morgan, Jane E.
16459067 9/17/2013	T/c with GDC re: shareholders agreements (0.3); correspondence with K. Shah and J. Ebberson re: same (0.2).	0.50	Everett li, Andrew H.
16459825 9/17/2013	Comm. with K. Shah and J. Ebberson re: board materials (.2) review same (.3).	0.50	Everett li, Andrew H.
16465788 9/17/2013	Comm. E. Fleck and FAs re board distribution (.4); prepare same (1.1); revise task list chart and comm. A. Davey (HL) re same (.5); email Chairman re signatures and docs (.2); comm. K. Shah re same and materials (.5): further revise task list (.3); comm. E. Fleck re same (.1); emails Chair re same (.2); further revise task list (.2); prepare email to audit committee with tomorrow's call materials (.4); comm. E. Fleck re same (.3); revise and circulate same (.2); prepare further email to board with materials (.4); comm. internally and with FAs re same (.4); revise and circulate same (.1); emails with Chairman and E. Fleck re lease and signature pages (.4).	5.70	Ulvad, Greta R.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/CORPORATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16461754 9/17/2013	Communications w/ K. Shah and A. Everett re: post-closing items and board meeting prep (.7); call w/ J. O'Grady re: closing sets (.1); communications w/ K. Shah and R. Lee re: TPG SPA (.1); draft certificate for RA Holdco 2 LLC evidencing ratification of TPG SPA (1.3); correspondence w/ K. Shah re: same (.2); prepare audit committee minutes template (.6).	3.10	Ebberson, James K.
16468812 9/17/2013	Call with GDC re sig pages for London lease (.2); Prep of sig pages for same (.6).	0.80	Kurtich, Amy
16459824 9/17/2013	Call and email with potential Singapore director (.7); communications with E. Fleck, K. Shah, FTI, and Houlihan re same (.4); review materials re Arcapita Pte. Limited (2.3); attention to authorized signatories on Singapore bank account (.6).	4.00	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16465796 9/17/2013	Call with J. O'Grady (GDC) re sharepoint site and closing sets (0.3), multiple calls and emails regarding signature pages related to London lease (2); communications with J. Morgan re closing set and finance issues (0.5); communications with N. Kamphaus regarding warrant production agent and AST (0.4); communications with A. Everett regarding data sites (0.5), respond to questions re resolutions re financing (0.2); communications with N. Kamphaus re bank accounts and Singapore employees (0.4), email final documents to B. Jordan (HL) (0.2); work on [REDACTED] (0.8); communications with J. Ebberson re meeting and minutes (0.5); work on notes for E. Fleck re [REDACTED] (0.5); email re removing directors from Topco (0.3), prepare template re audit committee meetings (0.3); respond to [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (1).	7.90	Shah, Kim M.
16460623 9/17/2013	Prepare an index for exhibits from RD's WS JJ's WS and DH's WS.	8.00	Jomier, Theophile

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01400 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/COURT HEARINGS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16437308 9/3/2013	Calendar omni hearing dates for internal team.	0.10	Ulvad, Greta R.
16447660 9/9/2013	Comm. N. Kamphaus and E. Fleck re matters coming up for hearing.	0.30	Ulvad, Greta R.
16452998 9/15/2013	Review docket re hearing schedule (.1); emails N. Kamphaus and E. Fleck re same (.2).	0.30	Ulvad, Greta R.
16465798 9/16/2013	Prepare notice re hearing cancellation (.5); comm. N. Kamphaus re same (.2).	0.70	Ulvad, Greta R.
16465799 9/17/2013	Prepare notice of cancellation of hearing (.1); comm. internally re same (.1).	0.20	Ulvad, Greta R.
16470422 9/17/2013	Review, revise and file NOA and Cancellation of 9/19 Hearing (.9); distribute same to internal team (.1); distribute same to claims agent for service (.1); prepare hearing transcript invoice and distribute same for payment (.2).	1.30	Thomas, Charmaine

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.01900 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/EMPLOYEE ISSUES**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16466491 9/2/2013	Review correspondence and drafts of directors plan (.3); review correspondence re [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (.1).	0.40	Krasnow, Joel I.
16469512 9/2/2013	Review and comment on director compensation plan and form of grant letters (.8); emails re same (.5); review enabling resolutions re same (.2).	1.50	Morgan, Jane E.
16469511 9/2/2013	Revise Incentive Plan and Incentive Plan Award agreement and circulate.	0.80	Stine, Aaron
16479838 9/2/2013	Review director incentive compensation agreement (.1); communications with corporate team re same (.1).	0.20	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16479839 9/3/2013	Review board incentive compensation terms (.3); draft insert for same (.3); communications with E. Fleck re same (.2).	0.80	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16446016 9/3/2013	Communications with A. Stine re incentive plan award agreements.	0.20	Mollo-Christensen, David
16446017 9/4/2013	Communications with A. Stine re board of directors compensation documents.	0.10	Mollo-Christensen, David
16443637 9/5/2013	Communications with A. Everett re Arcapita employees.	0.20	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16446018 9/5/2013	Draft form of director engagement letter.	1.20	Mollo-Christensen, David
16443629 9/7/2013	Review Board letter and plan.	0.20	Krasnow, Joel I.
16452977 9/9/2013	Comm. N. Kamphaus re Board compensation.	0.10	Krasnow, Joel I.
16459068 9/12/2013	Comm. with N. Kamphaus re [REDACTED] [REDACTED].	0.30	Mollo-Christensen, David
16459069 9/13/2013	Review [REDACTED].	0.10	Mollo-Christensen, David



**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.02300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/EXECUTORY CONTRACTS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16459071 9/10/2013	Review re assumed executory contracts and unexpired leases (1.3); corr. w/ N. Kamphaus re same (.2).	1.50	Tsang, Andrew C.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.02400 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/EXIT FINANCING**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16425936 9/1/2013	Review DIP/Exit and internal communication re: same.	1.00	Harris, Jennifer P.
16444692 9/2/2013	Review email correspondence relating to the Exit Facility.	0.10	Dewar, John R.
16425937 9/2/2013	Review exit conversion mechanics.	0.20	Harris, Jennifer P.
16459087 9/3/2013	Further correspondence on [REDACTED].	0.50	Pisa, Albert A.
16443638 9/3/2013	Call w/ J. Harris and corporate team re: execution of documents (.7); call to GD re: execution of documents (.2).	0.90	Fish, Julia E.
16469514 9/3/2013	Review credit agreement amendment provisions (.2); call re conversion from DIP to Exit (.7); review master murabaha (disposition expense) (.5).	1.40	Harris, Jennifer P.
16459088 9/4/2013	Follow-up on [REDACTED] (.7); follow-up on employee question (.3).	1.00	Pisa, Albert A.
16443643 9/4/2013	Review document/Insurance requirements and communication re: same.	0.50	Harris, Jennifer P.
16443640 9/5/2013	Correspondence re: finalizing forms of resolutions with A. Stine and Cayman counsel (1); review revised resolutions (1.5); checklist call with Gibson and Latham (.7); prepare comments to certificates and other closing documents (1.1).	4.30	Fish, Julia E.
16443644 9/5/2013	Communications re closing mechanics, signature pages, exit conversion.	1.00	Harris, Jennifer P.
16443641 9/6/2013	Correspondence re: execution of documents (1.8); circulated comments to certificates (.3); correspondence w/ M. Hussain re: English law document execution (.2).	2.30	Fish, Julia E.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.02400 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/EXIT FINANCING**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16443657 9/6/2013	Review final Disposition Expense Murabaha (.8); closing/exit conversion communication (.2).	1.00	Harris, Jennifer P.
16443642 9/8/2013	Correspondence re: status of execution of documents.	0.30	Fish, Julia E.
16459073 9/9/2013	Send comments on certificates (.2); calls with K. Shah re: signing process (.8); review closing deliverables (2.5); correspondence re: execution of documents (.5).	4.00	Fish, Julia E.
16446021 9/9/2013	Review ancillary documents, Director's certificate and GDC opinion (1.4); internal communications re same (.7); review Exit facility ongoing reporting obligations (.8).	2.90	Harris, Jennifer P.
16446022 9/10/2013	Rewiew re exit conversion - CPs, signature pages and communications re same.	1.50	Harris, Jennifer P.
16459075 9/11/2013	Correspondence re: execution of documents (1); correspondence re: execution of corporate and exit finance documents (2); review WCF agreements and circulate comments to J. Tiller at Gibson (3); calls and correspondence w/ Gibson re: status of closing deliverables (1.3).	7.30	Fish, Julia E.
16459082 9/11/2013	Review re closing checklist items and conditions precedent to closing.	2.00	Harris, Jennifer P.
16459076 9/12/2013	Review revised WCF agreements (2); review closing deliverables for exit financing (1); committee call (.9); comm. w/ E. Thaqi re: sending executed document (.2).	4.10	Fish, Julia E.
16459083 9/12/2013	Conference calls and review re cps for exit conversion.	2.00	Harris, Jennifer P.
16455014 9/12/2013	Assist with membership certificate.	2.50	Thaqi, Egzon

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.02400 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/EXIT FINANCING**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16452999 9/13/2013	Review GS expenses (.1); email E. Fleck and C. Delano re same (.1); email A. Goldberg (LW) re same (.1).	0.30	Ulvad, Greta R.
16459077 9/13/2013	Correspondence re: executed documents (1.5); review final drafts of WCF agreements (1.0); pre closing call with Latham and Gibson teams (.8); review closing deliverables (1.5).	4.80	Fish, Julia E.
16459084 9/13/2013	Closing conference calls (1.0); prepare for closing - CPs to closing (1.5).	2.50	Harris, Jennifer P.
16459078 9/14/2013	Correspondence re: execution of documents.	0.40	Fish, Julia E.
16459079 9/15/2013	Correspondence re: additional documents to be signed and process on closing date.	0.70	Fish, Julia E.
16459072 9/16/2013	Review exit financing correspondence (0.8); attention to open items (0.5); communications with J. Fish re same (0.1); review correspondence re exit (0.2).	1.60	Everett li, Andrew H.
16459080 9/16/2013	Correspondence re: execution of documents (.7); pre closing calls with Latham and Gibson (2.0); reviewed executed WCF agreements (.5); correspondence re: executing documents (.8); correspondence re: additional closing deliverables and confirmation of transaction request and offer and acceptance (.5).	3.80	Fish, Julia E.
16459085 9/16/2013	Communications and review re closing conditions and mechanics.	8.50	Harris, Jennifer P.
16459081 9/17/2013	Correspondence re: closing of Arcapita (2.6); communications w/ E. Fleck re: [REDACTED] (.2); [REDACTED] (.2); correspondence w/ K. Shah re: additional E. Davis signature pages (.3).	3.10	Fish, Julia E.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.02400 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/EXIT FINANCING**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16470424 9/17/2013	Draft cover letter re Membership Interest Certificate as per J.Fish; deliver Membership certificate.	2.00	Thaqi, Egzon

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.02500 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/FEE APPLICATIONS - OTHER**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16479840 9/6/2013	Communications with J. Alaradi (Hassan Radhi) re logistics for payment of fees (.1); communications with G. Ulvad re same (.2).	0.30	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16465800 9/16/2013	Comm'ns internally re fee app timing.	0.30	Ulvad, Greta R.
16465801 9/17/2013	Prepare email to UCC professionals re fee app (.2); review escrow agreement re same (.1); comm. N. Kamphaus re same (.1).	0.40	Ulvad, Greta R.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.02600 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/FILE, DOCKET & CALENDER MAINTENANCE**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16432960 9/3/2013	Review docket.	0.10	Thomas, Charmaine
16432961 9/4/2013	Review docket and update internal pleadings files and fee statements files.	0.20	Thomas, Charmaine
16469516 9/5/2013	Update pleading folder re new court filings (.2); comm w N. Bassett re service of complaint and summons (.2).	0.40	Brewster, Jacqueline
16432962 9/5/2013	Review dockets.	0.10	Thomas, Charmaine
16447661 9/6/2013	Draft summary of today's pleadings (1.1); corr. w/ internal team re same (.2).	1.30	Tsang, Andrew C.
16435749 9/6/2013	Review court docket (.1); update internal pleading files (.2).	0.30	Brewster, Jacqueline
16455017 9/9/2013	Review docket and update internal pleadings database.	0.30	Brewster, Jacqueline
16455018 9/12/2013	Update pleading folder re new court filings.	0.20	Brewster, Jacqueline
16455020 9/12/2013	Multiple corresps with L. Mandel re Fifth Omnibus Objection to Claims (.1); review court docket for same and circulate (.1); search for related responses and circulate same (.1).	0.30	Kazi, Rohan S.
16455019 9/13/2013	Review court docket (.1); update internal pleading files re same (.2).	0.30	Brewster, Jacqueline
16465802 9/16/2013	Prepare summary of today's filings and circulate same internally.	0.30	Ulvad, Greta R.
16470426 9/16/2013	Review court docket; research documents re filings and related pleadings.	0.40	Brewster, Jacqueline
16470429 9/16/2013	Review re notice requirements re new representation in same case.	0.60	Thomas, Charmaine

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.02600 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/FILE, DOCKET & CALENDER MAINTENANCE**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16470432 9/16/2013	Review court docket for recently filed Notices of Presentment of Stipulated Order Allowing Claims and upload to internal share drive for A. Tsang.	0.20	Kazi, Rohan S.
16470433 9/16/2013	Review several court dockets for notice of cancellation requests for G. Ulvad (.4); circulate additional requested pleadings to G. Ulvad (.2).	0.60	Kazi, Rohan S.
16459089 9/17/2013	Draft summary of today's pleadings.	0.20	Tsang, Andrew C.
16470430 9/17/2013	Review re service after the effective date (.2); revise pleadings files (.1).	0.30	Thomas, Charmaine



**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.02700 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/INVESTMENTS AND PORTFOLIO COMPANIES**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16461767 9/11/2013	Corresp. w/ J. Julian (HL) and E. Fleck re [REDACTED]	0.50	Lee, Roger

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.02800 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/INSURANCE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16447662 9/11/2013	Review D&O forms for potential changes (.4); emails E. Fleck and A. Stine re same (.1); email V. Ruiz (GDC) re same (.1).	0.60	Ulvad, Greta R.
16459108 9/11/2013	Review insurance requirements for new entity and communication re same.	2.00	Harris, Jennifer P.
16459092 9/11/2013	Analyze proposed D&O policy language (1.9); correspondence re: same (0.2); communicaitons with N. Kamphaus re: same (0.2).	2.30	Imoisili, Aluyah I.
16479842 9/12/2013	Communications with E. Fleck re D&O liability insurance.	0.30	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16459093 9/13/2013	Analyze proposed D&O policy terms.	1.40	Imoisili, Aluyah I.
16459094 9/15/2013	Draft analysis re: D&O insurance policy.	0.40	Imoisili, Aluyah I.
16465804 9/16/2013	Comm. E. Fleck re D&O forms (.3); comm. corporate team re same (.2); comm. V. Ruiz (GDC) re same (.2).	0.70	Ulvad, Greta R.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.03100 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/ISLAMIC FINANCE ISSUES**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16446280 9/4/2013	Correspondence re shariah committee issues w Milbank team (.5); consider issues re same (.3).	0.80	Newman, Peter
16466286 9/11/2013	Call w WTC and others re sukuk issues (.7); communications re same w N. Kamphaus (.6); call w Hogan re same (.4); discuss issue w E Fleck (.5); email re potential workaround (.7); consider alternatives and potential issues (.7).	3.60	Newman, Peter

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.03200 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/LITIGATION**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16461770 9/1/2013	Corresp. w/ N. Kamphaus re litigation questions from UCC member.	0.30	Lee, Roger
16459095 9/9/2013	Review correspondence re appeal.	0.40	Leblanc, Andrew M.
16459096 9/10/2013	Prepare correspondence re Alsohaibi appeal issues (0.8); review draft letter re same (0.3).	1.10	Leblanc, Andrew M.
16459097 9/11/2013	Review issues re stay.	0.50	Leblanc, Andrew M.
16479843 9/13/2013	Communications with A. Leblanc re pending litigation matters (.2); review relevant documents re same (.2).	0.40	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16474860 9/16/2013	Calls with A. Knight re appeal (0.3); reviewing materials and brief re same (1.2).	1.50	Leblanc, Andrew M.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.03300 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/MILBANK FEE STATEMENTS & APPLICATIONS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16437309 9/3/2013	Email internal team re August daynotes.	0.10	Ulvad, Greta R.
16437310 9/4/2013	Comm. A. Heckman re August daynotes (.1); prepare doc for daynote review (.1); begin reviewing same (.7).	0.90	Ulvad, Greta R.
16437311 9/5/2013	Continue to review August daynotes.	2.50	Ulvad, Greta R.
16437312 9/6/2013	Continue to review August daynotes.	4.40	Ulvad, Greta R.
16437313 9/7/2013	Continue reviewing August daynotes.	0.50	Ulvad, Greta R.
16437314 9/8/2013	Continue reviewing August daynotes.	2.20	Ulvad, Greta R.
16447663 9/9/2013	Continue reviewing August daynotes.	2.50	Ulvad, Greta R.
16447664 9/10/2013	Continue reviewing August daynotes (3.9); comm. A. Heckman re same (.1).	4.00	Ulvad, Greta R.
16447665 9/11/2013	Continue reviewing August daynotes.	2.10	Ulvad, Greta R.
16447666 9/12/2013	Continue reviewing August daynotes (4.6); comm. A. Heckman re same (.2).	4.80	Ulvad, Greta R.
16453000 9/13/2013	Emails with team members to time entries.	0.40	Ulvad, Greta R.
16453001 9/15/2013	Review August daynotes in pdf.	2.60	Ulvad, Greta R.
16465806 9/16/2013	Comm. A. Heckman re August daynotes (.2); comm. E. Fleck and N. Kamphaus re team email re daynotes and fee app (.5); prepare same (.2); review August expenses (.3).	1.20	Ulvad, Greta R.
16479844 9/16/2013	Review issues re fee applications and effective date.	0.20	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16465807 9/17/2013	Review expenses.	0.30	Ulvad, Greta R.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.03700 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/REAL ESTATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16425925 9/2/2013	Email correspondence with all parties re London sublease (.5); review updated draft re same (.5).	1.00	Tierney, Patrick R.
16469513 9/3/2013	O/C with H. Dworkis re: AHQ leases.	0.20	Everett li, Andrew H.
16446012 9/3/2013	Discuss additional leases with A. Everett (.2); review same (.4); email correspondence with Bahrain counsel re review of HQ leases (.4).	1.00	Dworkis, Hannah
16425926 9/3/2013	Email correspondence with opposing counsel re London sublease and transition to assignment concept.	0.50	Tierney, Patrick R.
16469515 9/4/2013	O/c with H. Dworkis re: Bahraini lease (0.4); review correspondence re: same (0.2).	0.60	Everett li, Andrew H.
16479845 9/4/2013	Communications with corporate team re Lusail transaction.	0.20	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16437305 9/4/2013	Email correspondence with opposing counsel re Atlanta Landlord form of consent (.3); review and mark up same (.4); email correspondence with J. Morgan re same (.2); email correspondence with A. Stine re same (.2); email correspondence with opposing counsel re London license of assignment and guarantee (.3); begin reviewing same (.7); telephone conference with opposing counsel re same (.4); mark up same and circulate comments to same to J. Morgan (.9).	3.40	Tierney, Patrick R.
16477268 9/5/2013	Review revised drafts re assignment of London lease and revise same (1.2); review draft for Atlanta landlord consent and revise same (.8); notes re same (.4); notes re issues on RA guarantee (.5); notice and technical issue re lease assignment (.9).	3.80	Morgan, Jane E.
16479846 9/5/2013	Communications with corporate team re headquarters settlement.	0.30	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.03700 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/REAL ESTATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16437306 9/5/2013	Review email correspondence with opposing counsel re Atlanta Landlord form of consent and London lease.	0.60	Tierney, Patrick R.
16477269 9/6/2013	Numerous calls and notes re London lease assignment.	1.40	Morgan, Jane E.
16469517 9/6/2013	O/c with H. Dworkis re: Arcapita leases (.2); review correspondence re same (.3).	0.50	Everett li, Andrew H.
16446014 9/6/2013	Summarize [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (1.7); discuss material issues summary with A. Everett (.2).	1.90	Dworkis, Hannah
16437307 9/6/2013	Review email correspondence with opposing counsel re Atlanta Landlord form of consent and London license and guarantee (.2); review markup of same (.2); email correspondence with J. Morgan re same (.1); circulate comments to London license and guarantee (.3).	0.80	Tierney, Patrick R.
16469518 9/8/2013	Notes re: London sublease issues.	0.60	Morgan, Jane E.
16469519 9/9/2013	Review draft licence to assign lease and provide mark-up to P. Tierney.	2.00	Altay, Merih O.
16469524 9/9/2013	Email correspondence re Atlanta consent (.2); review updated Atlanta consent (.3); email correspondence re same (.3).	0.80	Tierney, Patrick R.
16469528 9/10/2013	Review and revise RA guarantee in re: London lease assignment.	1.20	Morgan, Jane E.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.03700 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/REAL ESTATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16446020 9/10/2013	Email correspondence with J. Morgan and opposing counsel re Atlanta sublease (.5); email correspondence with opposing counsel re updated draft license/guarantee (.4); email correspondence with J. Morgan re same (.6); review comments from J. Morgan re same (.4); incorporate comments from J. Morgan and M. Altay re same (.8); circulate same to opposing counsel (.1).	2.80	Tierney, Patrick R.
16452995 9/11/2013	Email correspondence with J. Morgan and opposing counsel re London license/guarantee (.8); email correspondence with J. Morgan re same (.7); review updated draft of same (.9); telephone conference with opposing counsel re same (.6).	3.00	Tierney, Patrick R.
16469537 9/12/2013	Review revised london sublease and notes re same.	1.20	Morgan, Jane E.
16452976 9/12/2013	Email correspondence with local Bahrain counsel re review of settlement agreement and leases.	0.50	Dworkis, Hannah
16452996 9/12/2013	Review updated license/guarantee (.4); email correspondence with J. Morgan re same (.1); draft email memorandum re comments to same (.3); communications with J. Morgan re same (.4); update same and circulate same to opposing counsel (.6).	1.80	Tierney, Patrick R.
16469538 9/13/2013	Contact with J. Emly (GDC) re arrangements re 'contracting out' notice in connection with licence to assign lease and internal communications/ arrangements re same (0.5); review lease and related documents received from Gibson Dunn/ Pemberton Greenish and email traffic re same (1.0); coordinate arrangements for attendance of independent solicitor to witness statutory declaration (0.5).	2.00	Altay, Merih O.



**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.03700 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/REAL ESTATE MATTERS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16452997 9/13/2013	Review updated license/guarantee (.5); email correspondence with J. Morgan re same (.4); email correspondence with M. Altay re same (.3); communications with M. Altay re open real estate issues (.3).	1.50	Tierney, Patrick R.
16479847 9/14/2013	Review NMR issues re headquarters building (1.2); communications with J. Graves (Gibson Dunn) re same (.6).	1.80	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16449077 9/15/2013	Review local counsel comment on leases (.2); respond to questions re local counsel review from A. Everett (.3).	0.50	Dworkis, Hannah
16477271 9/16/2013	Signing Statutory Declaration.	0.50	Stamp, Mark
16469455 9/16/2013	Arrange and attend execution of statutory declaration, telephone and email contact re same with GDC and Pemberton Greenish, arrange for original to be couriered to PG (1.5); further telephone and email contact with GDC (0.4); arrange re-execution of statutory declaration and arrangements re attendance of witness (1); internal correspondence re RAH approval/ratification, review draft email to G. Davis (RA Chair)(0.6).	3.50	Altay, Merih O.
16461755 9/16/2013	Communications with M. Altay re open real estate issues (.2); review email correspondence re same (.3).	0.50	Tierney, Patrick R.
16469457 9/17/2013	Contact with Gibson Dunn re statutory declaration in relation to lease assignment and arranging for statutory declaration to be couriered to Pemberton Greenish.	0.30	Altay, Merih O.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.04000 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/REORGANIZATION PLAN**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16425946 9/3/2013	Communications with J. Morgan re effective date planning.	0.30	Fleck, Evan R.
16437315 9/3/2013	Comm. N. Kamphaus and R. Kazi re distribution procedures deck (.2); revise same (.5).	0.70	Ulvad, Greta R.
16479848 9/3/2013	Communications with Houlihan re implementation memorandum.	0.20	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16440070 9/3/2013	Conform Plan Distribution Procedures presentation to new template and prepare for external circulation.	2.30	Kazi, Rohan S.
16433870 9/4/2013	Continued effective date planning.	3.60	Fleck, Evan R.
16431950 9/4/2013	Review closing timing and issues.	0.40	Dunne, Dennis F.
16461772 9/4/2013	Review updated draft RA-GDC retention letter (.2); corresp. w/ E. Fleck re same (.2); corresp. w/ N. Kamphaus re post-effective date task allocation (.4); review draft RA-HL engagement letters (.6).	1.40	Lee, Roger
16437316 9/4/2013	Comm. N. Kamphaus re distribution procedures deck (.2); revise same (.1).	0.30	Ulvad, Greta R.
16479849 9/4/2013	Communications with E. Fleck re plan implementation.	0.10	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16446023 9/5/2013	Continued emails, calls and document revisions to plan for effective date.	5.30	Fleck, Evan R.
16461773 9/5/2013	Review post-effective date task allocations (.4); review RA-HL engagement letter re valuation services (1.7); review RA-HL engagement letter re advisory services (1.2).	3.30	Lee, Roger

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.04000 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/REORGANIZATION PLAN**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16437317 9/5/2013	Revise distribution procedures deck (.9); comm. N. Kamphaus re same (.1); comm. A. Stine re same (.1); comm. N. Kamphaus re prof escrow form (.1); call S. Fuller (A&M) re same (.1); prepare same (.2); email E. Fleck re same (.1).	1.60	Ulvad, Greta R.
16479850 9/5/2013	Revise distribution verification materials (1.4); communications with A. Tsang re same (.3); communications with J. Graves (Gibson Dunn) re same (.2); revise distribution procedures presentation (.7); communications with G. Ulvad re same (.1).	2.70	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16437318 9/6/2013	Continued work on effective date planning and coordination.	3.40	Fleck, Evan R.
16479851 9/6/2013	Communications with J. Graves (Gibson Dunn) re verification materials for distributions.	0.10	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16437319 9/7/2013	Comm. with J. Morgan re: indemnity agreement (.5); continued work on effective date planning items (2.8).	3.30	Fleck, Evan R.
16479852 9/8/2013	Draft email to Committee members re logistics of distributions (.5); communications with E. Fleck re same (.2).	0.70	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16453002 9/9/2013	Continued preparations for next week's effective date.	11.80	Fleck, Evan R.
16459106 9/9/2013	Emails with A. Stine and J. Fish re closing documents and signatures (.3); communications with E. Fleck re same (.2).	0.50	Bassett, Nicholas A.
16447667 9/9/2013	Comm. N. Kamphaus and R. Kazi re distribution procedures deck (.2); review and revise same (.2).	0.40	Ulvad, Greta R.
16479853 9/9/2013	Revise verification materials in connection with distributions (1.5); communications with corporate team re same (.3).	1.80	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.04000 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/REORGANIZATION PLAN**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16455013 9/9/2013	Multiple corresps. with G. Ulvad re Plan Distribution presentation (.2); incorporate edits re same (.6); prepare for external circulation (.1); follow up with G. Ulvad re same (.1); conform presentation to MTHM standard (.4).	1.40	Kazi, Rohan S.
16453003 9/10/2013	Continued work with board, internally, GDC, committee to prepare for occurrence of effective date.	9.40	Fleck, Evan R.
16459107 9/10/2013	Meet with client for execution of POR documents (2.1); prepare for same (1.3); coordinate with A. Stine and J. Fish re relevant documents and signature pages (.9).	4.30	Bassett, Nicholas A.
16447668 9/10/2013	Comm. N. Kamphaus re motion to compel (.2); review and revise same (.3); comm. L. Mandel re same (.4); review issues re same (.4).	1.30	Ulvad, Greta R.
16469526 9/10/2013	Prepare materials for distribution procedures presentation on UCC call (.6); revise notice to potential recipients of distributions (.6); review disbursing agent agreement re same (.2).	1.40	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16447670 9/11/2013	Numerous calls, emails, write-ups to facilitate effective date planning and processing.	10.70	Fleck, Evan R.
16459109 9/11/2013	Comm. N. Kamphaus re titling of plan securities pending distribution (.4); review authorities re same (1.2).	1.60	Foster Jr., Wilbur F.
16447669 9/11/2013	Comm. S. Fuller (A&M) re professional fee escrow (.1); comm. N. Kamphaus re same (.1); review same (.1).	0.30	Ulvad, Greta R.
16447017 9/11/2013	Review and revise revised motion to consummate plan (2.1); review related materials (.5).	2.60	Mandel, Lena
16449091 9/12/2013	Prepare for and attend meeting at Gibson-Dunn's office to work on closing sets.	10.30	Fleck, Evan R.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.04000 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/REORGANIZATION PLAN**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16459115 9/12/2013	Call with GCG and Gibson Dunn re plan distributions.	0.30	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16453004 9/13/2013	Continued work on plan closing/effective date matters, including numerous internal calls and meetings, discussions with Board and committee members.	8.90	Fleck, Evan R.
16453007 9/13/2013	Comms. with E. Fleck re closing issues (.3); review same (.4).	0.70	Dunne, Dennis F.
16461775 9/13/2013	Review execution version of RA-GDC engagement letter (.7); corresp. w/ E. Fleck re same (.3).	1.00	Lee, Roger
16466291 9/13/2013	Comm. re issues re post-emergence representation with N. Kamphaus (.2); discuss effective date payments issues (.4).	0.60	Newman, Peter
16479854 9/13/2013	Revise verification materials for distributions (1.6); communications with Milbank team re same (.5).	2.10	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16453005 9/14/2013	Continued work on effective date planning and coordination.	4.20	Fleck, Evan R.
16453006 9/15/2013	Continued work to prepare for effective date.	5.80	Fleck, Evan R.
16453008 9/15/2013	Review issues re closing and communications with E. Fleck re same.	1.20	Dunne, Dennis F.
16461776 9/15/2013	Review corrected RA-GDC engagement letter.	0.30	Lee, Roger
16461777 9/16/2013	Board calls, internal meetings and other discussions and writings in connection with plan effectiveness and board transition.	13.70	Fleck, Evan R.
16459110 9/16/2013	Review issues/timing re effective date.	0.30	Dunne, Dennis F.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.04000 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/REORGANIZATION PLAN**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16465810 9/16/2013	Prepare email to UCC re plan closing update (.1); review update emails and comm. E. Fleck re same (.4); revise and circulate update email (.1).	0.60	Ulvad, Greta R.
16479855 9/16/2013	Revise verification forms re distributions; communications with GCG re same; communications with FTI re same; communications with E. Fleck re same.	3.00	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16465812 9/17/2013	Continued work on going effective transactions and establishment of new board, etc.	14.80	Fleck, Evan R.
16465811 9/17/2013	Prepare email to UCC re effectiveness (.1); review update emails and comm. E. Fleck re same (.3); revise and circulate email to UCC (.1).	0.50	Ulvad, Greta R.
16461919 9/17/2013	Closing tasks, including conference calls, CP compliance, email communications.	4.30	Harris, Jennifer P.
16459833 9/17/2013	Revise verification materials for Plan distributions and communications re same.	2.00	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.04200 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/RETENTION OF PROFESSIONALS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16479856 9/4/2013	Communications with M. Riela (Latham) re status of EY retention application (.1); communications with E. Fleck re same (.1); follow-up communications with FTI re same (.2); review fee estimates from E&Y (.4); communications with FTI re same and re potential to engage new auditors (1.1); follow-up communications with E. Fleck re same (.4).	2.30	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16479857 9/6/2013	Communications with S. Star (FTI) re status of EY retention issues (.2); communications with P. Topper (FTI) re same (.3).	0.50	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16479858 9/7/2013	Call with FTI and Houlihan re status of auditor selection process and next steps (.4); communications with E. Fleck re same (.1).	0.50	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16479859 9/9/2013	Call with FTI re auditor selection process.	0.20	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16479860 9/10/2013	Communications with FTI re auditor retention issues (.3); review audit requirements for listing re same (.5); communications with J. Jackson and P. Newman re same (.2).	1.00	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16459116 9/11/2013	Call with KPMG re coordination with E&Y on 2012 audit (.3); communications with E. Fleck re same (.2); review KPMG engagement letter in connection with same (.6); draft email to E. Fleck re same (.3).	1.40	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16459117 9/12/2013	Communications with P. Topper (FTI) regarding retention of auditor.	0.10	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16453009 9/13/2013	Prepare email to UCC re E&Y retention (.4); emails internally and with FAs re same (.4); comm. N. Kamphaus re same (.3).	1.10	Ulvad, Greta R.
16479861 9/13/2013	Communications with FTI re EY retention issues (.2); communications with E. Fleck re same (.2).	0.40	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.04200 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/RETENTION OF PROFESSIONALS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16453010 9/15/2013	Review email to UCC re E&Y.	0.10	Ulvad, Greta R.
16479862 9/16/2013	Communications with FTI re EY application; communications with Latham re same.	0.40	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16459836 9/17/2013	Communications with FTI re reporting issues and retention of auditor (.2); attention to auditor retention issues (.3).	0.50	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.



**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.04500 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/SECURED CREDITOR ISSUES**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16461778 9/11/2013	Corresp. w/ P. Topper re latest SCB expense invoices.	0.40	Lee, Roger
16461774 9/12/2013	Review additional SCB expense invoices.	0.50	Lee, Roger

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.04700 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/TAX ISSUES**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16463638 9/10/2013	Comm. E. Fleck re tax function and transition post-emergence (.2); t/c S. Joffe and S. Star (FTI) re tax function and transition post-emergence (.3).	0.50	Walker, Andrew
16463639 9/11/2013	Emails w/E. Fleck re transition of tax function (.1); t/c J. Trinklein (GDC) re tax transition issues (.3); note re same (.2).	0.60	Walker, Andrew
16463640 9/12/2013	Comm. R. Kestenbaum re tax issue (.1); research 1099 reporting issues (.9).	1.00	Walker, Andrew
16459119 9/12/2013	Review tax-related question from Committee member (.3); communications with A. Walker re same (.6); communications with E. Fleck re same (.3).	1.20	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
16468820 9/17/2013	Consider question on taxable entities (.2); communications w/ N. Kamphaus re same (.1).	0.30	Walker, Andrew

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.05100 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/VOIDABLE TRANSFERS & OTHER POTENTIAL CLAIMS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16443660 9/1/2013	Comms re Bahraini counsel input on options for service of complaint/summons.	0.50	Vora, Samir
16425967 9/1/2013	Emails with E. Fleck and N. Kamphaus re questions about placement actions.	0.60	Bassett, Nicholas A.
16443661 9/2/2013	Further research into FRCP 4(f) and 4(h) re effective service.	1.00	Vora, Samir
16443663 9/2/2013	Further emails with Hassan Radhi re service issues (.3); research re same (.7); communications with S. Vora re same (.3).	1.30	Bassett, Nicholas A.
16443664 9/3/2013	Call with Hassan Radhi re service issues (.3); prepare for same (.2); emails re same with S. Vora (.2).	0.70	Bassett, Nicholas A.
16443662 9/4/2013	Further research into service options (.8); prepare email summary thereon (.5).	1.30	Vora, Samir
16443665 9/4/2013	Communications with S. Vora re service issues (.3); review letter re same (.2); review email re same (.1).	0.60	Bassett, Nicholas A.
16443666 9/6/2013	Emails with Hassan Radhi re placement action issues (.2); communications with S. Vora re same (.4).	0.60	Bassett, Nicholas A.
16459120 9/10/2013	Letters and p/c to clerk re foreign mailing.	1.00	Vora, Samir
16459121 9/12/2013	Comms w/Court clerk re issues related to foreign mailing.	0.50	Vora, Samir
16459122 9/12/2013	Communications with S. Vora re service of placement complaints (.3); review materials and research re same (.2).	0.50	Bassett, Nicholas A.
16474863 9/17/2013	Call and emails with S. Vora re service issues.	0.20	Bassett, Nicholas A.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.05100 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/VOIDABLE TRANSFERS & OTHER POTENTIAL CLAIMS**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16470437 9/17/2013	Follow-up with Y. Ayandipo re service of complaint and summons of Bahrain Islamic Bank and Tadamon Capital B.S.C.	0.20	Brewster, Jacqueline

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.05200 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/AIM MSA**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16443631	9/3/2013	Advice re MSA and related communications.	1.00 Aaron, Wayne M.
16463642	9/3/2013	Call w/HL to discuss issues on revised draft of MSA (1.0); review and revise same (.8); notes and calls re selection of counsel (.8); calls and notes re issues on assignment of London lease to AIM and scope of requested RA guarantee (1.2); numerous calls and notes re ancillary MSA and issues re transition to RA management and control (.6).	4.40 Morgan, Jane E.
16443668	9/3/2013	Review of MSA.	0.50 Heyl, Dorothy
16425969	9/3/2013	Comm. re revisions with J. Morgan (0.4); participate in call with HL to discuss MSA (0.5); revise MSA and circulate to GDC (1.1).	2.00 Stine, Aaron
16463643	9/4/2013	Review initial draft of ancillary MSA (1.5); discuss issues w/A. Stine (.4); call w/GDC to discuss draft and issues (.5).	2.40 Morgan, Jane E.
16443669	9/4/2013	Call from B. Thomas (GDC) on ancillary master services agreement (.5); review of scope of services in master services agreement (.6); communications re same (1.0).	2.10 Heyl, Dorothy
16425974	9/4/2013	Call with GDC regarding ancillary MSAs (.5); prepare for same (.1).	0.60 Shah, Kim M.
16463644	9/5/2013	Revise ancillary service agreement and discuss issues w/A. Stine (1.3); numerous calls and notes re issues on Asset Transfer Agreement (.8).	2.10 Morgan, Jane E.
16463645	9/6/2013	Review revised draft of MSA from GDC.	0.80 Morgan, Jane E.
16433871	9/6/2013	Communications re revisions with K. Shah (0.3); discuss revisions with HL (0.3).	0.60 Stine, Aaron

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.05200 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/AIM MSA**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16443670 9/7/2013	Review and revise MSA issues list (.8); notes re: same (.4); notes re: issues on ancillary service agreement form (.7).	1.90	Morgan, Jane E.
16433872 9/7/2013	Review revised draft of MSA (1.0); create and circulate MSA issues list (0.7); begin revising MSA (0.4).	2.10	Stine, Aaron
16433878 9/7/2013	Review revised MSA and issues list.	0.70	Shah, Kim M.
16443671 9/8/2013	Notes re: open issues on MSA and proposed resolutions re: same (1.8); call w/ K. Shah to discuss issues on incentive fee calculations (.7); review and revise draft of ancillary service agreement (.8).	3.30	Morgan, Jane E.
16433873 9/8/2013	Participate in call with HL to discuss MSA (0.3); revise MSA and circulate to GDC (2.6).	2.90	Stine, Aaron
16437321 9/8/2013	Review of changed pages and responses to issues list (1.7); review GDC changes to section 4.5(f) (.3); call with J. Morgan re revisions (0.7); email to A. Stine re same (0.2).	2.90	Shah, Kim M.
16463646 9/9/2013	Participate in call w/AIM and HL to discuss open issues on MSA (1.0); review draft asset transfer agreement (.8); notes and calls re scope of transferred assets and continuation of insurance cover (.9); issues re ancillary services agreement and proposed resolution (.8); review revised draft (.3).	3.80	Morgan, Jane E.
16447671 9/9/2013	Participate in call with HL and K. Shah to discuss MSA (0.8); participate in call with GDC regarding MSA and related Services agreement (1.4).	2.30	Stine, Aaron
16449100 9/9/2013	Call with A. Stine and HL regarding call with AIM (0.8); call with GDC regarding MSA and SA (1.4); prepare for same (.2).	2.40	Shah, Kim M.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.05200 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/AIM MSA**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16446019 9/9/2013	Review email from J. Morgan re Section 4.6 of MSA (.1); review draft language re same (.2); prepare email memorandum re comments to same and circulate to J. Morgan (.5); communications with M. Altay re same (.2).	1.00	Tierney, Patrick R.
16446026 9/10/2013	Review and comment on revised draft of MSA (.9); review ancillary services agreement (.5); email re same to B. Jordan (HL) (.4); call with A. Davey and W. McDavid (HL) re: calculation of incentive fee (.6); call w/ B. Jordan and M. Tan (Arc) re: open issues on MSA (.7).	3.10	Morgan, Jane E.
16447672 9/10/2013	Call with GDC and HL to discuss MSA (0.7); revise MSA (2.1).	2.80	Stine, Aaron
16449101 9/10/2013	Review revised draft (0.9); call with HL (0.6), meeting to determine formulas (0.7); comm. with J. Morgan re defintions (0.8).	3.00	Shah, Kim M.
16449096 9/11/2013	Review and revise HL deck to update UCC on current terms of MSA and verify statements against current draft of MSA (1.4); communications re issues with E. Fleck, K. Shah and A. Stine (.8); review and revise Asset Transfer Agreement and discuss issues re excluded assets (1.1); review and discuss revised drafts ancillary service agreements (.4); calls and notes re values set forth in Exhibit 9 in MSA (.7); calls to discuss open issues on MSA and update note to team re same (1.8).	6.20	Morgan, Jane E.
16459123 9/11/2013	Review of ancillary services agreement.	0.20	Heyl, Dorothy
16446025 9/11/2013	Participate in call with GDC to discuss MSA (0.7); revise MSA (3.5); revise ancillary MSA (0.6).	4.80	Stine, Aaron

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.05200 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/AIM MSA**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16469530 9/11/2013	Communications w/ A. Stine re: MSA (.3); review schedules to MSA (1.0); review schedules to services agreement (1.1); communications w/ A. Sine re: same (.2); diligence re: incentive fees (.4).	3.00	Ebberson, James K.
16449102 9/11/2013	Call with GDC re agreement (0.7); discuss revisions to agreement (0.6).	1.30	Shah, Kim M.
16449097 9/12/2013	Review and revise MSA to reflect input from HL on open business issues (.7); communications re proposed resolution with K. Shah (.8); discuss same with A. Davey and W. McDavid (HL) (.4); discuss same with B. Jordan (HL) (.3); review and revise Asset Transfer Agreement (.8); communications re same with A Everett (.3); review and discuss ancillary service agreements (.7); calls and notes re values set forth in Exhibit 9 in MSA (.7).	4.70	Morgan, Jane E.
16449093 9/12/2013	Revise MSA.	1.40	Stine, Aaron
16449103 9/12/2013	Call with B. Jordan from HL (0.3); call with W. McDavid and A. Davey from HL (0.4); revisions to MSA (1.0); call with GDC and HL re MSA (1.4); revise MSA (1.2).	4.00	Shah, Kim M.
16449098 9/13/2013	Numerous notes, calls and meetings to discuss [REDACTED] (2.2); review and comment on revised language in MSA to reflect resolution of other open issues (1.6); notes re issues on [REDACTED] (.7); review various schedules to confirm names and amounts for deals (1.0).	5.50	Morgan, Jane E.
16449094 9/13/2013	Revise MSA (1.2); correspondence with J. Morgan and A. Davey (HL) regarding MSA (0.4).	1.60	Stine, Aaron
16449104 9/13/2013	Call with A. Davey, W. McDavid (HL) (0.8); review changes from GDC (0.4); revise MSA (0.5); review exhibits of agreements (1.4).	3.10	Shah, Kim M.



**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Description of Legal Services

Ending September 17, 2013

**41276.05200 ARCAPITA CREDITORS' COMMITTEE/AIM MSA**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Name</b>
16449099 9/14/2013	Numerous notes re effect of proposed deletion of Tensar management agreement form MSA (1.2); notes re severance side letter (.6).	1.80	Morgan, Jane E.
16469539 9/14/2013	Review [REDACTED] (0.8); review emails re sideletter (0.2); respond to emails re DAA (0.3).	1.30	Shah, Kim M.
16453012 9/15/2013	Numerous notes, calls and meetings to discuss issues around portfolio test (1.7); review and comment on revised language (1.5); notes re issues on Tensar (.5).	3.70	Morgan, Jane E.
16449095 9/15/2013	Call with GDC to discuss open MSA items.	0.80	Stine, Aaron
16453013 9/15/2013	Review and revise multiple drafts of the MSA from GDC, multiple calls with GDC, multiple calls with HL.	9.10	Shah, Kim M.
16468822 9/16/2013	Review and revise numerous drafts of MSA and related schedules in order to finalize same for closing.	2.00	Morgan, Jane E.
16465819 9/16/2013	Revise and review MSA drafts and implement changes (2.7) calls with HL, and GDC, re same (1.8).	4.50	Shah, Kim M.

**Exhibit B**

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Ending September 17, 2013

**AIRFREIGHT**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<b>Name</b>
33301088 8/20/2013	AIRFREIGHT NEW YORK NY	14.82	Tsang, Andrew C.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Ending September 17, 2013

**CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<b>Name</b>
33214041 8/9/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION LOTUS:13333530/957790/2120 - 08/09/13 From:M,1 CHASE MANHATTAN PLZ To:BX, 10466	54.13	Thomas, Charmaine
33275490 8/19/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION LOTUS:13353529/941239/2026 - 08/19/13 From:M,1 CHASE MANHATTAN PLZ To:BX, 10455	25.61	Brewster, Jacqueline
33291091 8/26/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION LOTUS:13373532/958592/2088 - 08/26/13 From:M,1 CHASE MANHATTAN PLZ To:BX, 10455	60.02	Brewster, Jacqueline
33304570 8/26/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION CONCORD:612725/919198/080 - 08/26/13 From:1 CHASE MANHATTAN P To:SCARSDALE, NY	93.66	Morgan, Jane E.
33253765 9/6/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR A.STINE REF#191536 ON 08/31/13	20.00	Stine, Aaron
33253766 9/6/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR A.STINE REF#191537 ON 09/01/13	20.00	Stine, Aaron
33253767 9/6/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR A.STINE REF#191538 ON 09/02/13	20.00	Stine, Aaron
33253768 9/6/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR A.STINE REF#191539 ON 09/03/13	20.00	Stine, Aaron
33253769 9/6/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR A.STINE REF#191540 ON 09/05/13	20.00	Stine, Aaron
33291090 9/6/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION LOTUS:13373532/962167/2075 - 09/06/13 From:M,1 CHASE MANHATTAN PLZ To:BK, 11234	86.50	Kurtich, Amy
33264896 9/11/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR A.STINE REF#191541 ON 09/05/13	20.00	Stine, Aaron
33264897 9/11/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR A.STINE REF#191542 ON 09/06/13	20.00	Stine, Aaron

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Ending September 17, 2013

**CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<b>Name</b>
33264899 9/11/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR A.STINE REF#191543 ON 09/07/13	20.00	Stine, Aaron
33264900 9/11/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR A.STINE REF#191544 ON 09/08/13	20.00	Stine, Aaron
33264902 9/11/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR A.STINE REF#191545 ON 9/09/13	20.00	Stine, Aaron
33265064 9/11/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR A.EVERETT REF#191548 ON 09/09/13	20.00	Everett li, Andrew H.
33265065 9/11/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR A.EVERETT REF#191547 ON 09/10/13	20.00	Everett li, Andrew H.
33272908 9/13/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR K.SHAH REF#191562 ON 09/07/13	20.00	Shah, Kim M.
33272910 9/13/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR K.SHAH REF#191561 ON 08/30/13	20.00	Shah, Kim M.
33272911 9/13/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR K.SHAH REF#191805 ON 09/12/13	20.00	Shah, Kim M.
33272919 9/13/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR K.SHAH REF#191804 ON 09/11/13	20.00	Shah, Kim M.
33273072 9/13/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR K.SHAH REF#191803 ON 09/10/13	20.00	Shah, Kim M.
33273073 9/13/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR K.SHAH REF#191802 ON 09/09/13	20.00	Shah, Kim M.
33273074 9/13/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR K.SHAH REF#191801 ON 09/08/13	20.00	Shah, Kim M.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Ending September 17, 2013

**CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<b>Name</b>
33273137 9/13/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR A.STINE REF#191546 ON 09/10/13	20.00	Stine, Aaron
33273138 9/13/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR A.STINE REF#191549 ON 09/11/13	20.00	Stine, Aaron
33273139 9/13/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR A.STINE REF#191852 ON 09/12/13	20.00	Stine, Aaron
33279272 9/17/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR J.EBBBERSON REF#190740 ON 09/09/13	20.00	Ebberson, James K.
33279274 9/17/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR J.EBBBERSON REF#190741 ON 09/11/13	20.00	Ebberson, James K.
33279275 9/17/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR J.EBBBERSON REF#190742 ON 09/12/13	20.00	Ebberson, James K.
33279276 9/17/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR J.EBBBERSON REF#190743 ON 09/14/13	20.00	Ebberson, James K.
33279277 9/17/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR J.EBBBERSON REF#190744 ON 09/15/13	20.00	Ebberson, James K.
33279366 9/17/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR K.SHAH REF#191856 ON 09/14/13	20.00	Shah, Kim M.
33279367 9/17/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR K.SHAH REF#191806 ON 09/13/13	20.00	Shah, Kim M.
33279368 9/17/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR K.SHAH REF#191858 ON 09/16/13	20.00	Shah, Kim M.
33279369 9/17/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR K.SHAH REF#191857 ON 09/15/13	20.00	Shah, Kim M.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Ending September 17, 2013

**CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<b>Name</b>
33279377 9/17/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR A.EVERETT ON 09/15/13	20.00	Everett li, Andrew H.
33279378 9/17/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR A.EVERETT ON 09/12/13	20.00	Everett li, Andrew H.
33279379 9/17/2013	CAB FARES/LOCAL TRANSPORTATION - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M TRANS REIM FOR A.EVERETT ON 09/11/13	20.00	Everett li, Andrew H.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Ending September 17, 2013

**COLOR COPIES**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<b>Name</b>
33245777 9/3/2013	COLOR COPIES	53.00	Morgan, Jane E.
33245778 9/4/2013	COLOR COPIES	1.75	Everett li, Andrew H.
33245779 9/4/2013	COLOR COPIES	3.25	Sloan, Patricia Ann
33268832 9/9/2013	COLOR COPIES	30.50	Santamaria, Sueann
33274750 9/15/2013	COLOR COPIES	2.75	Kurtich, Amy
33279076 9/16/2013	COLOR COPIES	34.50	Morgan, Jane E.



**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Ending September 17, 2013

**MEAL, OVERTIME**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<b>Name</b>
33253799 9/6/2013	MEAL, OVERTIME - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M O/T MEAL REIM FOR R.KAZI ON 08/20/13	13.00	Kazi, Rohan S.
33253800 9/6/2013	MEAL, OVERTIME - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M O/T MEAL REIM FOR R.KAZI ON 08/20/13	17.00	Kazi, Rohan S.
33255220 9/9/2013	MEAL, OVERTIME - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M OT MEAL A STINE 9/7/13	12.00	Stine, Aaron
33255221 9/9/2013	MEAL, OVERTIME - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M OT MEAL A STINE 9/6/13	20.00	Stine, Aaron
33255222 9/9/2013	MEAL, OVERTIME - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M OT MEAL A STINE 9/5/13	20.00	Stine, Aaron
33255223 9/9/2013	MEAL, OVERTIME - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M OT MEAL A STINE 9/4/13	20.00	Stine, Aaron
33255227 9/9/2013	MEAL, OVERTIME - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M OT MEAL A STINE 9/3/13	20.00	Stine, Aaron
33265066 9/11/2013	MEAL, OVERTIME - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M O/T MEAL REIM FOR A.EVERETT ON 08/29/13	12.75	Everett li, Andrew H.
33270742 9/12/2013	MEAL, OVERTIME - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M O/T MEAL REIM FOR A.STINE ON 09/07/13	20.00	Stine, Aaron
33270744 9/12/2013	MEAL, OVERTIME - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M O/T MEAL REIM FOR A.STINE ON 09/08/13	20.00	Stine, Aaron
33270745 9/12/2013	MEAL, OVERTIME - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M O/T MEAL REIM FOR A.STINE ON 09/10/13	20.00	Stine, Aaron
33270748 9/12/2013	MEAL, OVERTIME - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M O/T MEAL REIM FOR A.STINE ON 09/09/13	20.00	Stine, Aaron
33270882 9/12/2013	MEAL, OVERTIME - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M O/T MEAL REIM FOR A.STINE ON 09/08/13	12.00	Stine, Aaron
33270973 9/12/2013	MEAL, OVERTIME - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M O/T MEAL REM FOR E.FLECK ON 09/09/13	18.75	Fleck, Evan R.
33272907 9/13/2013	MEAL, OVERTIME - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M O/T MEAL REIM FOR K.SHAH ON 09/07/13	10.59	Shah, Kim M.
33273115 9/13/2013	MEAL, OVERTIME - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M O/T MEAL REIM FOR A. KURTICH ON 09/10/13	20.00	Kurtich, Amy
33273116 9/13/2013	MEAL, OVERTIME - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M O/T MEAL REIM FOR A.KURTICH ON 09/11/13	10.25	Kurtich, Amy

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Ending September 17, 2013

**MEAL, OVERTIME**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<b>Name</b>
33273117 9/13/2013	MEAL, OVERTIME - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M O/T MEAL REIM FOR A.KURTICH ON 09/11/13	17.83	Kurtich, Amy
33273118 9/13/2013	MEAL, OVERTIME - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M O/T MEAL REIM FOR A.KURTICH ON 09/06/13	20.00	Kurtich, Amy
33273146 9/13/2013	MEAL, OVERTIME - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M O/T MEAL REIM FOR A.KURTICH ON 09/09/13	20.00	Kurtich, Amy
33273147 9/13/2013	MEAL, OVERTIME - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M O/T MEAL REIM FOR A.KURTICH ON 09/12/13	20.00	Kurtich, Amy
33273149 9/13/2013	MEAL, OVERTIME - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M O/T MEAL REIM FOR A.STINE ON 09/12/13	20.00	Stine, Aaron
33273150 9/13/2013	MEAL, OVERTIME - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M O/T MEAL REIM FOR A.STINE ON 09/11/13	20.00	Stine, Aaron
33279285 9/17/2013	MEAL, OVERTIME - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M O/T MEAL REIM FOR J.EBBERSON ON 09/15/13	9.09	Ebberson, James K.
33279286 9/17/2013	MEAL, OVERTIME - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M O/T MEAL REIM FOR J.EBBERSON ON 09/14/13	8.70	Ebberson, James K.
33279287 9/17/2013	MEAL, OVERTIME - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M O/T MEAL REIM FOR J.EBBERSON ON 09/11/13	11.50	Ebberson, James K.
33279355 9/17/2013	MEAL, OVERTIME - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M O/T MEAL REIM FOR A.EVERETT ON 09/15/13	10.45	Everett li, Andrew H.
33279365 9/17/2013	MEAL, OVERTIME - - VENDOR: CASHIER- MTH&M O/T MEAL REIM FOR K.SHAH ON 09/15/13	18.46	Shah, Kim M.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Ending September 17, 2013

**PHOTOCOPIES**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<b>Name</b>
33245769	9/3/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	0.40	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
33245770	9/3/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	10.30	Everett li, Andrew H.
33245771	9/3/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	11.10	Stine, Aaron
33245772	9/3/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	48.60	Sloan, Patricia Ann
33245787	9/3/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	2.90	Lee, Roger
33245789	9/3/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	9.30	Stine, Aaron
33246887	9/3/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	1.80	Harris, Jennifer P.
33247702	9/3/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	33.60	Giles, Stuart
33245773	9/4/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	4.60	Everett li, Andrew H.
33245774	9/4/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	38.00	Stine, Aaron
33245775	9/4/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	15.00	Sloan, Patricia Ann
33245776	9/4/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	6.10	Kurtich, Amy
33245788	9/4/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	7.50	Lee, Roger
33245790	9/4/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	4.70	Heyl, Dorothy
33247703	9/4/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	0.70	Hussain, Munib
33253551	9/5/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	1.90	Everett li, Andrew H.
33253554	9/5/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	3.20	Fish, Julia E.
33253555	9/5/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	7.20	Fish, Julia E.
33253557	9/5/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	0.30	Ulvad, Greta R.
33253558	9/5/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	11.10	Stine, Aaron
33263363	9/5/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	2.50	Walsh, Margaret
33256019	9/6/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	10.40	Fish, Julia E.
33256020	9/6/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	9.60	Stine, Aaron
33256720	9/6/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	0.70	Hussain, Munib
33256721	9/6/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	0.80	Hussain, Munib

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Ending September 17, 2013

**PHOTOCOPIES**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<b>Name</b>
33256017	9/7/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	80.80	Shah, Kim M.
33268792	9/8/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	1.80	Shah, Kim M.
33268782	9/9/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	1.80	Tsang, Andrew C.
33268785	9/9/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	15.30	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
33268788	9/9/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	16.50	Schaffer, Mark A.
33268793	9/9/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	16.70	Everett li, Andrew H.
33268794	9/9/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	10.80	Ulvad, Greta R.
33268795	9/9/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	3.30	Stine, Aaron
33268796	9/9/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	22.70	Kurtich, Amy
33268797	9/9/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	14.20	Shah, Kim M.
33268820	9/9/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	61.00	Ebberson, James K.
33268827	9/9/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	9.40	Santamaria, Sueann
33269959	9/9/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	50.70	Finch, Victoria
33268786	9/10/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	7.10	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
33268798	9/10/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	22.40	Everett li, Andrew H.
33268799	9/10/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	31.60	Ulvad, Greta R.
33268800	9/10/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	6.00	Stine, Aaron
33268801	9/10/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	32.60	Kurtich, Amy
33268802	9/10/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	2.60	Shah, Kim M.
33268821	9/10/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	59.80	Ebberson, James K.
33268828	9/10/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	14.80	Santamaria, Sueann
33268829	9/10/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	4.70	Stine, Aaron
33269961	9/10/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	0.70	Hussain, Munib
33285468	9/10/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	439.00	D.c.-Duplicating,
33268783	9/11/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	8.90	Tsang, Andrew C.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Ending September 17, 2013

**PHOTOCOPIES**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<b>Name</b>
33268789	9/11/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	3.20	Marino, Donna L.
33268803	9/11/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	28.40	Everett li, Andrew H.
33268804	9/11/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	0.50	Stine, Aaron
33268805	9/11/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	31.50	Kurtich, Amy
33268806	9/11/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	0.50	Shah, Kim M.
33268822	9/11/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	128.60	Ebberson, James K.
33268830	9/11/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	10.00	Stine, Aaron
33268831	9/11/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	4.60	Santamaria, Sueann
33269962	9/11/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	37.60	Leggat, Robert A.
33269963	9/11/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	29.40	Jomier, Theophile
33286594	9/11/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	2.10	Walsh, Margaret
33286596	9/11/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	5.90	Harris, Jennifer P.
33268790	9/12/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	14.40	Ulvad, Greta R.
33268807	9/12/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	6.10	Stine, Aaron
33268808	9/12/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	2.40	Shah, Kim M.
33268823	9/12/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	6.20	Ebberson, James K.
33272325	9/12/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	20.60	Tsang, Andrew C.
33272326	9/12/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	6.60	Everett li, Andrew H.
33272327	9/12/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	2.20	Stine, Aaron
33272328	9/12/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	120.00	Kurtich, Amy
33272329	9/12/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	9.50	Shah, Kim M.
33272333	9/12/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	60.00	Fish, Julia E.
33272334	9/12/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	171.70	Fish, Julia E.
33272335	9/12/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	0.10	Thaqi, Egzon
33272338	9/12/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	15.60	Ebberson, James K.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Ending September 17, 2013

**PHOTOCOPIES**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<b>Name</b>
33272339	9/12/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	9.50	Stine, Aaron
33272340	9/12/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	0.60	Santamaria, Sueann
33286597	9/12/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	1.00	Harris, Jennifer P.
33274730	9/13/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	2.00	Tsang, Andrew C.
33274731	9/13/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	7.40	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
33274733	9/13/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	1.40	Everett li, Andrew H.
33274734	9/13/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	171.70	Stine, Aaron
33274735	9/13/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	18.70	Kurtich, Amy
33274736	9/13/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	12.80	Shah, Kim M.
33274737	9/13/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	0.40	Morgan, Jane E.
33274759	9/13/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	8.90	Jurpalis, Edith
33274760	9/13/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	24.80	Fish, Julia E.
33274761	9/13/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	24.90	Fish, Julia E.
33274762	9/13/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	92.00	Ebberson, James K.
33274764	9/13/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	20.10	Otero, Maritza
33274765	9/13/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	0.10	Otero, Maritza
33274767	9/13/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	9.80	Stine, Aaron
33284218	9/13/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	0.80	Hussain, Munib
33284222	9/13/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	0.10	Hussain, Munib
33285467	9/13/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	33.40	Chase, Annette
33286595	9/13/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	68.80	Walsh, Margaret
33274738	9/14/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	8.80	Stine, Aaron
33274739	9/14/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	45.70	Ebberson, James K.
33274740	9/14/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	20.60	Kurtich, Amy
33274741	9/14/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	22.60	Shah, Kim M.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Ending September 17, 2013

**PHOTOCOPIES**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<b>Name</b>
33274742	9/14/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	24.80	Ebberson, James K.
33274763	9/14/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	18.80	Ebberson, James K.
33274743	9/15/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	0.40	Everett li, Andrew H.
33274744	9/15/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	0.70	Stine, Aaron
33274745	9/15/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	12.40	Ebberson, James K.
33274746	9/15/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	0.70	Shah, Kim M.
33274768	9/15/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	18.60	Morgan, Jane E.
33274732	9/16/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	5.40	Ulvad, Greta R.
33274747	9/16/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	1.50	Ebberson, James K.
33274748	9/16/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	0.10	Everett li, Andrew H.
33274749	9/16/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	1.20	Ulvad, Greta R.
33279066	9/16/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	0.70	Tsang, Andrew C.
33279067	9/16/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	1.50	Schaffer, Mark A.
33279068	9/16/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	5.80	Ulvad, Greta R.
33279069	9/16/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	4.50	Everett li, Andrew H.
33279070	9/16/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	31.50	Ebberson, James K.
33279071	9/16/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	7.30	Shah, Kim M.
33279074	9/16/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	6.90	Marecki, Patrick
33279075	9/16/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	1.00	Morgan, Jane E.
33284131	9/16/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	18.40	Penney, David
33284215	9/16/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	1.00	Finch, Victoria
33284219	9/16/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	99.30	Leggat, Robert A.
33286598	9/16/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	0.10	Harris, Jennifer P.
33283460	9/17/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	3.00	Tsang, Andrew C.
33283461	9/17/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	87.20	Schaffer, Mark A.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Ending September 17, 2013

**PHOTOCOPIES**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<b>Name</b>
33283462	9/17/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	23.40	Ulvad, Greta R.
33283463	9/17/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	3.50	Marino, Donna L.
33283465	9/17/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	0.80	Everett li, Andrew H.
33283466	9/17/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	32.50	Ebberson, James K.
33283467	9/17/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	1.80	Kurtich, Amy
33283468	9/17/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	7.10	Shah, Kim M.
33283471	9/17/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	1.30	Brewster, Jacqueline
33283473	9/17/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	21.10	Ulvad, Greta R.
33284220	9/17/2013 PHOTOCOPIES	17.90	Benger, Philip



**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Ending September 17, 2013

**PRINTING**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<b>Name</b>
33245780	9/3/2013 PRINTING	0.50	Stine, Aaron
33245781	9/3/2013 PRINTING	14.70	Sloan, Patricia Ann
33245782	9/3/2013 PRINTING	0.20	Kurtich, Amy
33245791	9/3/2013 PRINTING	7.40	Morgan, Jane E.
33245783	9/4/2013 PRINTING	1.90	Sloan, Patricia Ann
33245784	9/4/2013 PRINTING	0.90	Kurtich, Amy
33245785	9/4/2013 PRINTING	3.00	Morgan, Jane E.
33245786	9/4/2013 PRINTING	7.70	Tierney, Patrick R.
33246888	9/4/2013 PRINTING	0.30	Vora, Samir
33253550	9/5/2013 PRINTING	0.20	Bevilacqua, Theresa
33253552	9/5/2013 PRINTING	4.40	Sloan, Patricia Ann
33253553	9/5/2013 PRINTING	0.10	Morgan, Jane E.
33253556	9/5/2013 PRINTING	4.70	Fish, Julia E.
33253559	9/5/2013 PRINTING	4.90	Morgan, Jane E.
33256016	9/6/2013 PRINTING	0.70	Bevilacqua, Theresa
33256018	9/6/2013 PRINTING	1.00	Sloan, Patricia Ann
33256021	9/6/2013 PRINTING	5.00	Morgan, Jane E.
33268791	9/9/2013 PRINTING	0.80	Schaffer, Mark A.
33268809	9/9/2013 PRINTING	4.00	Kurtich, Amy
33268810	9/9/2013 PRINTING	0.60	Morgan, Jane E.
33268811	9/9/2013 PRINTING	2.10	Tierney, Patrick R.
33268818	9/9/2013 PRINTING	5.70	Jurpalis, Edith
33268819	9/9/2013 PRINTING	0.30	Fish, Julia E.
33268824	9/9/2013 PRINTING	0.20	Ebberson, James K.
33268833	9/9/2013 PRINTING	8.20	Santamaria, Sueann

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Ending September 17, 2013

**PRINTING**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<b>Name</b>
33268834	9/9/2013 PRINTING	16.80	Morgan, Jane E.
33269960	9/9/2013 PRINTING	1.20	Finch, Victoria
33268812	9/10/2013 PRINTING	4.70	Kurtich, Amy
33268813	9/10/2013 PRINTING	0.10	Morgan, Jane E.
33268814	9/10/2013 PRINTING	1.00	Tierney, Patrick R.
33268825	9/10/2013 PRINTING	0.70	Ebberson, James K.
33268835	9/10/2013 PRINTING	14.10	Santamaria, Sueann
33268836	9/10/2013 PRINTING	17.40	Morgan, Jane E.
33285469	9/10/2013 PRINTING	0.50	D.c.-Duplicating,
33286599	9/10/2013 PRINTING	8.60	Vora, Samir
33286600	9/10/2013 PRINTING	0.40	Aalberts, Beth A.
33268781	9/11/2013 PRINTING	2.80	Fleck, Evan R.
33268784	9/11/2013 PRINTING	0.10	Tsang, Andrew C.
33268787	9/11/2013 PRINTING	0.40	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
33268815	9/11/2013 PRINTING	1.20	Kurtich, Amy
33268816	9/11/2013 PRINTING	16.90	Morgan, Jane E.
33268826	9/11/2013 PRINTING	0.10	Ebberson, James K.
33268837	9/11/2013 PRINTING	22.70	Santamaria, Sueann
33268838	9/11/2013 PRINTING	19.10	Morgan, Jane E.
33286601	9/11/2013 PRINTING	5.80	Vora, Samir
33268817	9/12/2013 PRINTING	0.60	Kurtich, Amy
33268839	9/12/2013 PRINTING	2.40	Morgan, Jane E.
33272330	9/12/2013 PRINTING	0.50	Marino, Donna L.
33272331	9/12/2013 PRINTING	0.10	Kurtich, Amy
33272332	9/12/2013 PRINTING	7.20	Morgan, Jane E.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Ending September 17, 2013

**PRINTING**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<b>Name</b>
33272336	9/12/2013 PRINTING	4.20	Thaqi, Egzon
33272337	9/12/2013 PRINTING	4.40	Fish, Julia E.
33272341	9/12/2013 PRINTING	6.50	Santamaria, Sueann
33272342	9/12/2013 PRINTING	21.10	Morgan, Jane E.
33274729	9/13/2013 PRINTING	0.70	Fleck, Evan R.
33274751	9/13/2013 PRINTING	0.30	Marino, Donna L.
33274752	9/13/2013 PRINTING	13.30	Morgan, Jane E.
33274766	9/13/2013 PRINTING	0.30	Otero, Maritza
33274769	9/13/2013 PRINTING	8.80	Santamaria, Sueann
33274770	9/13/2013 PRINTING	16.10	Morgan, Jane E.
33284216	9/13/2013 PRINTING	0.20	Finch, Victoria
33274753	9/14/2013 PRINTING	6.70	Ebberson, James K.
33274754	9/14/2013 PRINTING	2.50	Kurtich, Amy
33274755	9/15/2013 PRINTING	0.10	Stine, Aaron
33274756	9/15/2013 PRINTING	7.20	Ebberson, James K.
33274757	9/15/2013 PRINTING	0.10	Morgan, Jane E.
33274771	9/15/2013 PRINTING	1.10	Morgan, Jane E.
33274758	9/16/2013 PRINTING	0.50	Kurtich, Amy
33279072	9/16/2013 PRINTING	1.90	Ebberson, James K.
33279073	9/16/2013 PRINTING	2.10	Fish, Julia E.
33279077	9/16/2013 PRINTING	0.80	Morgan, Jane E.
33284217	9/16/2013 PRINTING	0.10	Finch, Victoria
33285526	9/16/2013 PRINTING	3.30	Chase, Annette
33283464	9/17/2013 PRINTING	1.40	Schaffer, Mark A.
33283469	9/17/2013 PRINTING	0.30	Ebberson, James K.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Ending September 17, 2013

**PRINTING**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<b>Name</b>
33283470 9/17/2013	PRINTING	1.80	Kurtich, Amy
33283472 9/17/2013	PRINTING	0.80	Kaytrosh, John Peter

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Ending September 17, 2013

**TELEPHONE**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<b>Name</b>
33291588 7/31/2013	TELEPHONE - - VENDOR: TOTAL LTD` TELEPHONE - BLACKBERRY CHARGES	19.25	Newman, Peter
33264675 9/1/2013	TELEPHONE SOUNDPATH	15.78	Fleck, Evan R.
33258288 9/3/2013	TELEPHONE DALLAS TX STINE, AARON 5534	2.92	Stine, Aaron
33258296 9/3/2013	TELEPHONE WASHINGTON DC HEYL, DOROTHY 5088	0.22	Heyl, Dorothy
33257583 9/4/2013	TELEPHONE NEW YORK NY VORA, S. 4595	7.69	Vora, Samir
33258287 9/4/2013	TELEPHONE ROANOKE VA ULVAD, GRETA 5086	2.45	Ulvad, Greta R.
33258289 9/4/2013	TELEPHONE DALLAS TX EVERETT, ANDREW 5623	0.72	Everett li, Andrew H.
33264677 9/4/2013	TELEPHONE SOUNDPATH	8.27	Stine, Aaron
33264678 9/4/2013	TELEPHONE SOUNDPATH	5.35	Morgan, Jane E.
33264679 9/4/2013	TELEPHONE SOUNDPATH	3.99	Everett li, Andrew H.
33264680 9/4/2013	TELEPHONE SOUNDPATH	10.79	Fish, Julia E.
33264681 9/4/2013	TELEPHONE SOUNDPATH	5.37	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
33258290 9/5/2013	TELEPHONE DALLAS TX EVERETT, ANDREW 5623	1.83	Everett li, Andrew H.
33258291 9/5/2013	TELEPHONE CAYMAN IS CI STINE, AARON 5534	2.28	Stine, Aaron

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Ending September 17, 2013

**TELEPHONE**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<b>Name</b>
33258293 9/5/2013	TELEPHONE IRVINE CA LEE, ROGER 5707	1.37	Lee, Roger
33258294 9/5/2013	TELEPHONE ROANOKE VA ULVAD, GRETA 5086	1.05	Ulvad, Greta R.
33258292 9/6/2013	TELEPHONE DALLAS TX STINE, AARON 5534	1.37	Stine, Aaron
33258295 9/6/2013	TELEPHONE DENVER CO LEE, ROGER 5707	0.36	Lee, Roger
33264676 9/7/2013	TELEPHONE SOUNDPATH	2.90	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
33277140 9/9/2013	TELEPHONE WATERTOWN NY FLECK, EVAN 5567	0.34	Fleck, Evan R.
33277146 9/9/2013	TELEPHONE CHICAGO IL EVERETT, ANDREW 5623	0.34	Everett li, Andrew H.
33277147 9/9/2013	TELEPHONE CHICAGO IL EVERETT, ANDREW 5623	3.50	Everett li, Andrew H.
33277148 9/9/2013	TELEPHONE CAYMAN IS CI STINE, AARON 5534	2.28	Stine, Aaron
33287674 9/9/2013	TELEPHONE SOUNDPATH	24.22	Fleck, Evan R.
33287677 9/9/2013	TELEPHONE SOUNDPATH	16.57	Ulvad, Greta R.
33287683 9/9/2013	TELEPHONE SOUNDPATH	18.20	Stine, Aaron
33277141 9/10/2013	TELEPHONE CHICAGO IL FLECK, EVAN 5567	2.09	Fleck, Evan R.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Ending September 17, 2013

**TELEPHONE**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<b>Name</b>
33277142 9/10/2013	TELEPHONE SCAND MARN MN KAMPHAUS, NICK 5140	0.72	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
33277145 9/10/2013	TELEPHONE BAHRAIN ULVAD, GRETA 5086	81.60	Ulvad, Greta R.
33277149 9/10/2013	TELEPHONE DALLAS TX STINE, AARON 5534	1.09	Stine, Aaron
33277150 9/10/2013	TELEPHONE DALLAS TX EVERETT, ANDREW 5623	0.22	Everett li, Andrew H.
33277151 9/10/2013	TELEPHONE BAHRAIN ULVAD, GRETA 5086	11.17	Ulvad, Greta R.
33277152 9/10/2013	TELEPHONE BAHRAIN ULVAD, GRETA 5086	129.04	Ulvad, Greta R.
33277158 9/10/2013	TELEPHONE FLSCHR-MCL VA FISH, JULIA 5492	1.39	Fish, Julia E.
33277159 9/10/2013	TELEPHONE CHICAGO IL FISH, JULIA 5492	0.34	Fish, Julia E.
33277160 9/10/2013	TELEPHONE FLSCHR-MCL VA FISH, JULIA 5492	0.69	Fish, Julia E.
33277143 9/11/2013	TELEPHONE CAYMAN IS CI KAMPHAUS, NICK 5140	3.84	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
33277153 9/11/2013	TELEPHONE CAYMAN IS CI STINE, AARON 5534	2.28	Stine, Aaron
33277154 9/11/2013	TELEPHONE DALLAS TX STINE, AARON 5534	0.36	Stine, Aaron

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Ending September 17, 2013

**TELEPHONE**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<b>Name</b>
33277155 9/11/2013	TELEPHONE DALLAS TX EBBERSON, JAMES 5139	0.36	Ebberson, James K.
33277156 9/11/2013	TELEPHONE DALLAS TX EBBERSON, JAMES 5139	0.36	Ebberson, James K.
33287675 9/11/2013	TELEPHONE SOUNDPATH	11.97	Fleck, Evan R.
33287679 9/11/2013	TELEPHONE SOUNDPATH	18.31	Shah, Kim M.
33276285 9/12/2013	TELEPHONE NEW YORK NY VORA, S. 4595	2.20	Vora, Samir
33276286 9/12/2013	TELEPHONE NEW YORK NY VORA, S. 4595	0.72	Vora, Samir
33276287 9/12/2013	TELEPHONE NEW YORK NY VORA, S. 4595	0.36	Vora, Samir
33276288 9/12/2013	TELEPHONE NEW YORK NY VORA, S. 4595	0.36	Vora, Samir
33276289 9/12/2013	TELEPHONE NEW YORK NY VORA, S. 4595	2.56	Vora, Samir
33277144 9/12/2013	TELEPHONE COLO SP MA CO KAMPHAUS, NICK 5140	7.33	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
33277162 9/12/2013	TELEPHONE WASHINGTON DC HEYL, DOROTHY 5088	1.39	Heyl, Dorothy
33287678 9/12/2013	TELEPHONE SOUNDPATH	50.34	Ulvad, Greta R.
33287682 9/12/2013	TELEPHONE SOUNDPATH	7.87	Fish, Julia E.



**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Ending September 17, 2013

**TELEPHONE**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<b>Name</b>
33277157 9/13/2013	TELEPHONE SUGAR LAND TX STINE, AARON 5534	0.36	Stine, Aaron
33277161 9/13/2013	TELEPHONE CAYMAN IS CI FISH, JULIA 5492	8.53	Fish, Julia E.
33287676 9/13/2013	TELEPHONE SOUNDPATH	2.74	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
33287680 9/13/2013	TELEPHONE SOUNDPATH	18.65	Everett li, Andrew H.
33287681 9/13/2013	TELEPHONE SOUNDPATH	4.13	Shah, Kim M.
33309203 9/15/2013	TELEPHONE SOUNDPATH	12.10	Fleck, Evan R.
33309205 9/15/2013	TELEPHONE SOUNDPATH	8.04	Morgan, Jane E.
33298554 9/16/2013	TELEPHONE RCHMNDRSBG TX ULVAD, GRETA 5086	0.36	Ulvad, Greta R.
33298556 9/16/2013	TELEPHONE DENVER CO KAMPHAUS, NICK 5140	4.76	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
33298557 9/16/2013	TELEPHONE ATLANTA GA KAMPHAUS, NICK 5140	6.99	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
33298559 9/16/2013	TELEPHONE KALAMAZOO MI EVERETT, ANDREW 5623	2.09	Everett li, Andrew H.
33298560 9/16/2013	TELEPHONE BAHRAIN ULVAD, GRETA 5086	60.27	Ulvad, Greta R.
33298568 9/16/2013	TELEPHONE CHICAGO IL FISH, JULIA 5492	1.75	Fish, Julia E.
33309206 9/16/2013	TELEPHONE SOUNDPATH	2.08	Morgan, Jane E.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Ending September 17, 2013

**TELEPHONE**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<b>Name</b>
33309207 9/16/2013	TELEPHONE SOUNDPATH	1.42	Morgan, Jane E.
33309208 9/16/2013	TELEPHONE SOUNDPATH	35.06	Ulvad, Greta R.
33309209 9/16/2013	TELEPHONE SOUNDPATH	13.63	Fish, Julia E.
33309210 9/16/2013	TELEPHONE SOUNDPATH	14.59	Fish, Julia E.
33297600 9/17/2013	TELEPHONE NEW YORK NY VORA, S. 4595	2.92	Vora, Samir
33298551 9/17/2013	TELEPHONE TWINCITIES MN FLECK, EVAN 5567	4.02	Fleck, Evan R.
33298552 9/17/2013	TELEPHONE UNITED KIN GDOM FLECK, EVAN 5567	1.32	Fleck, Evan R.
33298558 9/17/2013	TELEPHONE ROANOKE VA ULVAD, GRETA 5086	0.44	Ulvad, Greta R.
33298561 9/17/2013	TELEPHONE DALLAS TX EBBERSON, JAMES 5139	0.68	Ebberson, James K.
33298562 9/17/2013	TELEPHONE UNITED KIN GDOM KURTICH, AMY 5146	5.98	Kurtich, Amy
33298569 9/17/2013	TELEPHONE CHICAGO IL FISH, JULIA 5492	0.34	Fish, Julia E.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Ending September 17, 2013

**TRAVEL (H)**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<b>Name</b>
33186044 8/2/2013	TRAVEL (H) - - VENDOR TRAVEL TO PARTICIPATE IN STN HEARING.	583.66	Leblanc, Andrew M.
33238653 8/8/2013	TRAVEL (H) CAB TO AIRPORT TO RETURN TO NEW YORK FOR ARCAPITA MATTER (LEAVE VACATION EARLY).	101.56	Morgan, Jane E.

**MILBANK, TWEED, HADLEY & McCLOY LLP**

Ending September 17, 2013

**WESTLAW**

	<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<b>Name</b>
33256381	9/2/2013	WESTLAW	84.80	Bassett, Nicholas A.
33275090	9/9/2013	WESTLAW	21.78	Kamphaus, Nicholas C.
33275091	9/10/2013	WESTLAW	217.76	Ulvad, Greta R.
33275089	9/13/2013	WESTLAW	21.78	Tsang, Andrew C.